105TH DAY) THURSDAY, MARCH 14, 1974 5249

ONE HUNDRED FIFTH DAY
St. Paul, Minnesota, Thursday, March 14, 1974.

The Senate met at 10 o’clock a.m. and was called to order by
the President.

CALL OF THE SENATE

Mr. Coleman imposed a call of the Senate. The following Sen-
ators answered to their names:

Anderson Dunn Kleinbaum, Olson, H. D. Spear
Arnold Fitzsimons Krieger Olson, J. L. Stokowski
Bang Frederick Laufenburger (FNeill Tennessen
Berg Hansen, Baldy Lewis Patton Thorup
Bernhagen Hansen, Mel Lord Perpich, G. Ueland
Borden Hanson, R. McCutcheon  Pillsbury Wegener
Chmielewski Hughes Milton Purfeerst Willet
Coleman Josefson Novak Renneke

Conzemius Keefe, S, Ogdahl Schrom

Davies Kirchner Oison, A. G.  Sillers

The Sergeant-at-Arms was instructed to bring in the absent
members.

Prayer by the Chaplain.

The roll being called, the following Senators answered to their
names;

Anderson Doty Keefe, S. North Schaal
Arnold Dunn Kirchner Novak Schrom
Ashbach Fitzsimons Kleinbaum Ogdahl Sillers
Bang Frederick Knutson Olhoft Solon
Berg Gearty Kowalczyk Olson, A.G. Spear
Bernhagen Hansen, Baldy Krieger Olson, H. D.  Stassen
Borden Hansen, Mel Larson Olsen, J. L. Stokowski
Brown Hanson, R. Laufenburger O’'Neill Tennessen
Chenoweth Hughes Lewis Paiton Thorup
Chmielewski Humphrey Lord Perpich, G. Ueland
Coleman Jensen MecCutcheon  Pillsbury Wegener
Conzemius Josefson Milton Purfeerst Willet
Davies Keefe, J. Nelson Renneke

Quorum present.
The reading of the Journal was dispensed with and the Journal,
as printed and corrected, was approved.
MEMBERS EXCUSED

Messrs. Blatz, Moe and Perpich, A. J. were excused from the
Session of today. Mr. Nelson was excused from the early part of
today’s Session. '



5250 JOURNAL OF THE SENATE [105TH DAY

INTRODUCTION OF BILLS
Mr. Milton introduced—

S. F. No. 3570: A bill for an act relating to review by the metro-
politan council of municipal plans; establishing a deadline; amend-
g Minnesota Statutes 1971, Secton 473B.08, Subdivision 7.

Which was read the first time and referred to the Committee on
Metropolitan and Urban Affairs.

Messrs. Kleinbaum, Lord and Bang introduced—-

5. F. No. 3571: A bill for an act creating a legislative commission
to study taxation of nonreturnable containers of all kinds.

Which was read the first time and referred to the Committee on
Taxes and Tax Laws.

Mr. Humphrey introduced—

S. F. No. 3572: A bill for an act relating to the governor; creating
3 governor’s commission on physical fitness; prescribing powers and
uties.

Which was read the first time and referred to the Committee on
Governmental Operations.

Messrs. Lewis and Gearty introduced—

S. F. No. 3573: A bill for an act relating to Hennepin county;
beards of review; creating an appointed board of equalization.

‘Which wags read the first time and referred to the Committee on
Metropolitan and Urban Affairs.

MESSAGES FROM THE HOUSE
Mr. President:

I have the honor to announce the passage by the House of the
following House Files, herewith transmitted:

H. F. Nos. 2243, 3035, 3105, 3313 and 3571.
Edward A. Burdick, Chief Clerk, House of Representatives
Transmitted March 13, 1974

FIRST READING OF HOUSE BILLS

H. F. No. 2243: A bill for an act providing for the creation,
organization, administration, and funetions of a Iennepin-Seott
Minnesota river bridge authority as a local government unit;
authorizing the authority to acquire, construct, finance, operate,
and maintain a bridge and the approaches thereto across the
Minnesota river connecting state highway 101 and Hennepin
county state aid highway 18; repealing Laws 1971, Chapter 739.



105TH DAY] THURSDAY, MARCH 14, 1974 5251

H. F. No. 3035: A bill for an act relating to mass transit;
approving the bus service expansion report and providing funds
therefor; setting bus fares; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971,
Section 473.09 and Minnesota Statutes, 1973 Supplement, Section
473A.111, Subdivision 1.

H. F. No. 3105: A bill for an act relating to status of dis-
appeared persons; providing for receivers and the possession,
management, and disposition of property; providing for proceed-
ings to establish the date of death of a person who has dis-
appeared and the eligibility for life insuranee payments prior to
determination of death; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Sec-
tions 487.14; 487.27, Subdivision 3, as amended; 518.01; 525.71;
576.01; 576.04; 576.10; 576.12, by adding a subdivision; 576.14;
576.15; 576.16; and Chapter 576, by adding sections.

H. F. No. 3313: A bill for an act regarding concession facilities
at the Minnesota zoological garden; amending Minnesota Stat-
utes 1971, Section 85A.03, Subdivision 4.

H. F. No. 3571: A bill for an act relating to the legislature;
providing for the filing of reports with the legislature; amending
Minnesota Statutes 1971, Chapter 3, by adding a section.

Which were read the first time and referred to the Committee on
Rules and Administration.

REPORTS OF COMMITTEES

Mr. Coleman moved that the Committee Reports at the Desk,
with the exception of S. F. No. 2296, be now adopted. The mo-
tion prevailed.

Mr. Gearty from the Committee on Governmental Operations,
to which was referred

S. F. No. 2296: A bill for an act relating to the policemen’s re-
lief association in the city of Columbia Heights; membership of
cf:erii?in police personnel in the public employees police and fire
und.

Reports the same back with the recommendation that the bill
be amended as follows:

Strike everything after the enacting clause and insert in lieu
thereof:

“Section 1. Notwithstanding the provisions of any general or
special law to the contrary, all firemen first employed after Janu-
ary 1, 1974, shall be members of the public employees police and
fire fund operated pursuant to Minnesota Statutes, Sections 353.63
to 353.68. All such firemen are not members of the fire relief
association of the city of Columbia Heights and are not subject
to any law relating thereto.

Sec. 2. State aid funds for fire relief associations received by
the city of Columbia Heights pursuant to Minnesota Statutes,
Sections 69.021 to 69.04 may be transferred to the fire relief



5952 JOURNAL OF THE SENATE [105TH DAY

association of the city of Columbia Heights in accordance with
those sections, or retained in whole or in part by the city and
allocated as a portion of the required employer’s pension contri-
bution for firemen who are members of the public employees
police and fire fund.

Sec. 3. The governing body of such firemen's relief association
shall consist of a board of trustees composed of six members to
be elected by the active members of the association or by the
retired members if there are no active members, based on the
present membership of ten men as of January 1, 1974, Any
vacancy in the board shall be filled in the manner prescribed in
this section. The affairs of the association shall be managed by
the board of trustees in the manner prescribed by law- or the
articles of incorporation of the association. When every member
of the fire relief association of the city of Columbia Heights is
deceased, the funds of such association shall become a trust fund
managed for the benefit of the recipients of such funds.

Sec. 4. Nothwithstanding the provisions of Minnesota Statutes,
Section 69.77, Subdivision 2, from and after January 1, 1974, the
members of the association shall pay into the retirement funds
of the aszsociation a contribution of not less than eight percent
of the salary of a first grade fireman,

Sec. 5. From and after the effective date of this act each asso-
ciation shall, upon application of any member whose employment
is terminated or who for any other reason ceases to be a member of
the association before qualifying for a pension or disability bene-
fits, refund to the member the total of his accumulated contribu-
tions to the association without interest.

Sec. 6. The minimum obligation of the city of Columbia Heights
to the firemen’s relief association shall be determined and pro-
vided by Minnesota Statutes, Sections 69.71 to 69.77, except that
the normal cost shall be computed as a percentage of the salary
paid only to members of the asscciation,

Sec. 7. Commencing in the year 1982, in addition fo the mini-
mum obligation required by sections 69.71 to 69.77, the city of
Columbia Heights will provide additional financing to the firemen'’s
relief association sufficient to amortize by the year 2012 the fund
deficits as determined in accordance with Minnesota Statutes, Sec-
tion 69.73.

Sec. 8. This act does specifically supersede those parts of Min-
nesota Session Laws 1965, Chapter 605, in conflict therewith in
regards to membership in the public employees retirement asso-
ciation.

Sec. 9. No new firemen’s relief agsociation in the city of Columbia
Heights to provide benefits to be paid firemen shall be established
except by specific enactment of the legislature or by chartered
amendments to the charter of the city of Columbia Heights.

Sec. 10. This act is effective upon approval by the governing
body of the city of Columbia Heights and upon compliance with
Minnesota Statutes, Section 645.021.”



105TH DAY} THURSDAY, MARCH 14, 1974 5253

Further, amend the title as follows:
Line 2, strike “policemen’s” and insert “firemen’s”
Line 4, strike “police” and insert “fire”

And when so amended the bill do pass and be placed on the Cal-
endar of Ordinary Matters.

Pursuant to Joint Rule 20, the bill was re-referred to the Com-
mittee on Rules and Administration.

Mr. Gearty from the Committee on Governmental Operations,
to which was re-referred

H. F. No. 3398: A bill for an act relating to retirement; autho-
rizing, under specified conditions and circumstances, a participant
in the Minnesota unclassified employees retirement program to
withdraw employer and employee shares therefrom and transfer
such shares to the highway patrolmen’s retirement fund.

Reports the same back with the recommendation that the bill
do pass. Report adopted.

Mr. Novak from the Committee on Finance, to which was re-
referred

S. F. No. 1205: A bill for an act regulating public utilities
furnishing at retail natural, manufactured or mixed gas, or electric
service; prescribing the duties of the public service commission;
prohibiting conflicts of interest on the public service commission in
relation thereto; prescribing penalties; increasing the membership
of the public service commission; amending Minnesota Statutes
1971, Section 216A.03, Subdivision 1; and Chapter 216A by adding
a section.

Reports the same back with the recommendation that the bill
be amended as follows:

Page 51, line 14, after “5.” strike the remainder of the line
Page 51, line 15, strike “in the state treasury.”

P(eil’ge 51, line 17, strike ‘“this account” and insert “the general
fund”

Page 51, line 17, strike “All moneys in the account are” and
insert “There is appropriated, upon passage of the act to the de-
partment of public service, from the general fund for the biennium
(;}rllfiingtJune 30, 1975, the sum of $300,000 for the purposes of

is act.”

Page 51, strike lines 18 through 21
Further, amend the title as follows:
Page 1, line 8, after “thereto;” insert “appropriating money;”

And when so amended the bill do pass. Amendments adopted.
Report adopted.



5954 JOURNAL OF THE SENATE [105TH DAY

Mr. Davies from the Committee on Judiciary, to which was
referred

H. F. No. 3289: A bill for an act relating to courts; county court
witness and mileage fees; amiending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Sec-
tion 487.34.

Reports the same back with the recommendation that the bill
do pass and be placed on the Calendar of Ordinary Matters. Re-
port adopted.

Mr. Davies from the Committee on Judiciary, to which was
re-referred

H. F. No. 2699: A bill for an act relating to the registration
of title to real estate; charges on registration; amending Minne-
sota Statutez 1971, Section 508.74.

Reports the same back with the recommendation that the bill
dg passdand be placed on the Calendar of Ordinary Matters. Report
-adopted.

Mr. Davies from the Commitiee on Judiciary, to which was
re-referred

H. F. No. 158: A bill for an act relating to courts; allowing the
use of video tape equipment to record depositions; making video
taped depositions admissable in court.

Reports the same back with the recommendation that the print-
ed bill be amended as follows:

Page 1, line 3, strike “pursuant to Minnesota Statutes 1971,
Page 1, line 4, strike “Section 597.01,”
Page 1, after line 10, insert

“Sec. 4. Sections 1 to 3 shall be superseded, pursuant to Minne-
sota Statutes, Section 480.056, if the supreme court adopts a rule
of civil procedure authorizing the use of video tape or other filmed
deposition.

Sec. 5. This act, if not superseded, shall expire July 1, 1976.”

And when so amended the bill do pass. Amendments adopted.
Report adopted.

Mr. Coleman from the Committee on Rules and Administration,
to which were referred H, F. Nos. 3032 and 3506 for comparison to
companion Senate Files, reports the following House Files were
found identical and recommends the House Files be given their
Se(io?ld Reading and substituted for their companion Senate Files
as follows:

CALENDAR OF

GENERAL ORDERS ORDINARY MATTERS CALENDAR
H.F. No. S8 F.No. HF.No. SF.No. H.F.No. 8.F.No.
3032 2828

3506 3398

And that the above Senate Files be indefinitely postponad.



105TH DAY] THURSDAY, MARCH 14, 1974 5255

Pursuant to Rule 49, this report was prepared and submitted by
the Secretary of the Senate on behalf of the Committee on Rules
and Administration. Report adopted.

Mr. Coleman from the Committee on Rules and Administration,
to which were referred H. F. Nos. 2848, 2990, 3400, 3190, 3395,
3436, 3422, and 2477 for comparison to companion Senate Files,
reports the following House Files were found not identical with
their companion Senate Files as follows:

CALENDAR CF

GENERAL ORDERS ORDINARY MATTERS CALENDAR
H.F. No. S F.No. H.F.No. S.F.No. H.F.No. S.F. No,
2848 2769 2990 3080
3400 3221 3190 3196
3436 3293 3395 3388
2477 2469 3422 3297

Pursuant to Rule 49 the Committee recommends that H. F. No.
2848 be amended as follows:

Page 1, lines 12, 13 and 14, restore the stricken language.

Page 1, line 14, after “clestion” and before the period insert
the following language:
“except that if sufficient judges are availeble to provide counting
teams of four or more judges evenly divided between the political
parties J’c’)r each box, an additional box or boxes may be opened and
counte

Page 1, after line 18, add a new Sec. 2 to read:

“Sec. 2. [EFFECTIVE DATE.] This act shall take effect the
day following final enactment.”

Page 1, delete lines 19 to 30
Page 2, delete lines 1 to 7

Amend the title, page 1, line 5, strike “Sections” and insert in
lieu thereof “Section” and after “Subdivision 2” delete the semi-
colon and insert in lieu thereof a period.

Page 1, delete all of line 6

And when so amended, H. F. No. 2848 will be identical to S. F.
No. 2769 and further recommends that H. F, No. 2848 be given
its second reading and substituted for S. F. No. 2769 and S. F. No.
2769 be indefinitely postponed.

Pursuant to Rule 49 the Committee recommends that H. F. No.
2990 be amended as follows:

] E’age 92, line 9, after “being” and before “engaged” insert “regu-
arly”

Page 2, line 10, after “at” and before “Minnesota” delete “the”
and insert in lieu thereof “any”



5266 JOURNAL OF THE SENATE [105TH DAY
Page 2, line 10, after “state” insert “correctional institution”
Page 2, line 11, delete “reformatory for men”

Page 2, line 14, delete “reformatory for men” and insert in lieu
thereof “stote correctional institution”

And when so amended, H. F. No. 2990 will be identical to S, F.
No. 3080 and further recommends that H. F. No. 2990 he given
its second reading and substituted for S. F. No. 3080 and S. F.
No. 3080 be indefinitely postponed.

Pursuant to Rule 49 the Committee recommends that H. F. No,
3400 be amended as follows:

Page 3, line 11, delete , beginning January 1, 1973,
Page 5, line 5, delete “If the total amount”
Page 5, delete lines 6 to 9

And when so amended, H. F. No. 3400 will be identical to S. F.
No. 3221 and further recommends that H. F. No. 3400 be given its
second reading and substituted for S. F. No. 3221 and S. F. No.
3221 be indefinitely postponed.

Pursuant to Rule 49 the Committee recommends that H. F. Ne.
3190 be amended as follows:

Page 1, line 20, delete “such” and insert in lieu thereof “the”

And when so amended, H. F. No. 3190 will be identical to S. F.
No. 3196 and further recommends that H. F. No. 3190 be given its
second reading and substituted for 5. F. No. 3196 and S. F. No.
3196 be indefinitely postponed.

Pursuant to Rule 49 the Committee recommends that H. F. No.
3395 be amended as follows:

Page 1, delete lines 8 through 19 and insert in lieu thereof the
following:

“Subd. 3. [VACANCY FILLED AT SPECIAL OR OTHER
ELECTION.] In all cases other than those provided in subdivi-
sions 1 and 2 and notwithstanding subdivision 2, if any vacancy
in the legislature occurs after the last day of the session in odd-
numbered years but more than 33 days prior to the date set for
convening the legislature in the next even-numbered year , the
governor shall issue his writ , seasonably calling the special elec-
tion for such time that the person elected may tale office at the



105TH DAY] THURSDAY, MARCH 14, 1974 b257

opening of the next session of the congress or of the legislature ,
or at the reconvening of a session of the congress or of the legis-
lature, so that candidates for the special election may be nomi-
nated as provided in section 203.46.”

And when so amended, H. F. No. 3395 will be identical to S, F.
No. 3388 and further recommends that H. F. No. 3395 be given ita
second reading and substituted for S. F. No. 3388 and S. F. No.
3388 be indefinitely postponed.

Pursuant to Rule 49 the Committee recommends that H. F.
No. 3436 be amended as follows:

Strike everything after the enacting clause and insert in lieu
thereof the following:

“Section 1. [UNIFORM FIRE CODE; ADOPTION.] Subdivi-
sion 1. The commissioner of public safety through the division of
fire marshall may promulgate a uniform fire code and make
amendments thereto in accordance with the administrative pro-
cedure act, Minnesota Statutes, Chapter 15.

Subd. 2. {(a) Unless otherewise specifically listed, wherever in
the text of the uniform code reference is made to a national fire
protection association pamphlet, the date of issue of that pam-
phlet shall be the one listed in the 1972-1973 edition of the na-
tional fire codes, as promulgated by the national fire protection
association,

(b) Wherever in the text of the uniform fire code reference
is made to the electrical code, it shall be the national electrical
code, 1971 edition.

Subd. 3. The commissioner shall adopt rules and regulations,
in accordance with Minnesota Statutes, Chapter 15, as may be
necessary to administer and enforce the code, specifically includ-
ing but not limited to rules and regulations for inspection of
buildings and other structures covered by the code and conform-
ing the code to the governmental organization of Minnesota state
agencies, political subdivisions and local governments.

Sec. 2. [EFFECTIVE DATE.] This act shall take effect the
day following its enactment.”

Further, amend the title by striking it in its entirety and in-
serting in lieu thereof the following:

“A bill for an act relating to public safety; authorizing the
commissioner of public safety to promulgate a uniform fire code;
adopting the uniform fire code, 1971 edition, promulgated by
the international conference of building officials and the western
firée chiefs association, until the commissioner promulgates a
code.”

And when so amended, H. F. No. 3436 will be identical to S. F.



5258 JOURNAL OF THE SENATE [106TH DAY

No. 3293 and further recommends that H. F. No. 3436 be given
its second reading and substituted for S. F. No. 3293 and S. F.
No. 3293 be indefinitely postponed.

Pursuant to Rule 49 the Committee recommends that H, .
No. 3422 be amended as follows:

Page 2, line 14, after “completed” delete the comma
Page 2, line 15, after “possible” delete the comma
Page 2, line 19, delete “hereof”
Page 2, line 20, delete “hereof”’

And when so amended, H. F, No. 3422 will be identical to S. F.
No. 3297 and further recommends that . F. No. 3422 be given
its second reading and substituted for S. F. No. 3297 and S. F.
No. 3297 be indefinitely postponed.

Pursuant to Rule 49 the Committee recommends that H. F. No.
2477 be amended as follows:

Strike everything after the enacting clause and insert in lieu
thereof the following:

“Section 1. [471.8371] [CONTRACTS FOR CONSTRUCTION
OF TREATMENT WORKS.] Subdivision 1. [POLICY.] The
United States Environmental Protection Agency has promulgated
rules and regulations under the Federal Water Pollution Control
Act which authorize the award of grants for treatment works
to be constructed under a contract providing for single source
responsibility for the design and construction of the facilities.
The legislature determines that such contracts should help pre-
vent pollution, thereby protecting the public health and the en-
vironment, by encouraging more effective use of existing tech-
nology and the development of new technology for waste treat-
ment, by assuring that treatment works will be designed and
built to meet applicable treatment standards, and by reducing
the time interval between the initial application for a grant and
the commencement of operation of the facilities.

Subd. 2. [AUTHORIZATION OF DESIGN AND CON-
STRUCTION CONTRACTS.] Notwithstanding the provisions of
any law to the contrary, any municipality authorized by law to
enter inio a contract for the construction of treatment works fa-
cilities may advertise for sealed bids for the design and construc-
tion thereof under a single contract. Prior to such advertisement
the municipality shall prepare contract documents which shall
serve as a basis for the comparison of bids and any contract to be
entered into. These documents may be of a general nature, and



105TH DAY) THURSDAY, MARCH 14, 1974 5259

shall include performance standards for the construction and su-
pervisional operation of the facilities which must be met for spec-
tfied conditions and time periods, prior to final acceptance of the
facilities by the municipality. The contract documents may require
the bidder to furnish conceptual design plans and specifications
and any other information deemed relevant for contract award.
After award the documents may require the bidder to furnish de-
tailed plans and specifications and provide for termination of the
contract if such information is insufficient to permit the municipal-
ity to satisfy the requirements of any federal or state grant.

Subd. 3. [LIMITATIONS.] The provisions of subdivision 2
shall not in any way limit the application and effect of laws gov-
erning the practice of architecture, professional engineering, or land
surveying in this state, including Minnesota Statutes, Sections
326.02 and 326.03.

Subd. 4. [DEFINITIONS.] As used in this section, “munici-
pality” has the meaning given to it in Minnesota Statutes, Section
471.345; and “treatment works” has the meaning given to it in
Section 212, Title II, of the Federal Water Pollution Control Act
Amendments of 1972.

Sec. 2. This act is effective the day following final enactment.”

And when so amended, H. F. No. 2477 will be identical to S. F.
No. 2469 and further recommends that H. F. No. 2477 be given
its second reading and substituted for S. F. No. 2469 and S. F. No.
2469 be indefintely postponed.

Pursuant to Rule 49, this report was prepared and submitted by
the Secretary of the Senate on behalf of the Committee on Rules
and Administration. Amendments adopted. Report adopted.

Mr. Coleman from the Committee on Rules and Administration,
to which were referred H. F. Nos. 2243 and 3105 for comparison to
companion Senate Files, reports the following House Files were
found to have no companion Senate Files on Senate Calendars and
arefrﬁcommended to be re-referred to their respective Committees
as follows:

H. F. No. 2243 to the Committee on Governmental Operations.

H. F. No. 3105 to the Committee on Judiciary.

Pursuant to Rule 49, this report was prepared and submitted by
the Secretary of the Senate on behalf of the Committee on Rules
and Administration. Report adopted.

SECOND READING OF SENATE BILLS

S. F. No. 1205 was read the second time.

SECOND READING OF HOUSE BILLS

H. F. Nos. 3398, 3289, 2699, 158, 3032, 3506, 2848, 2990, 3400,
3190, 3395, 3436, 3422 and 2477 were read the second time.



5260 JOURNAL OF THE SENATE [105TH DAY

MOTIONS AND RESOLUTIONS

Mr. Schaaf moved that his name be stricken from 8. F, No. 1597.
The motion prevailed.

Mr. Coleman, from the Committee on Rules and Administration,
offered the following resolution:

BE IT RESOLVED, by the Senate, that the following named
persons be and are hereby appointed to the position hereinafter
stated and at the salary heretofore fixed.

Father George Porthan, Chaplain, effective March 8, 1974
Rev. Barbara Andrews, Chaplain, effective March 18, 1974

Mr. Coleman moved to take up the Senate Calendar at this time,
remaining on the Order of Business of Motions and Resolutions.
The motion prevailed.

SUSPENSION OF RULES

Mr. Coleman moved that the Rules of the Senate be so far
suspended as to waive the lie-over requirement on Senate Files
on the Calendar. The motion prevailed.

THIRD READING OF SENATE BILLS

S. F. No. 1879: A bill for an act relating to insuranee; licensing
and regulation of insurance premium finance companies; grant-
ing rule-making authority; and providing penalties.

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.
The question being taken on the passage of the bhill,

And the roll being called, there were yeas 58 and nays 0, as
follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Arnold Fitzsimons Kleinbaum Ogdahl Schrom
Bang Frederick Knutson Olhoft Sillers
Berg Gearty Kowalczyk Olson, A. G. Solon
Bernhagen Hansen, Baldy Krieger Olson, H. D. Spear
Borden Hansen, Mel Larson Olson, J. L, Stassen
Chenoweth Hanson, R. Laufenburger O'Neill Stokowski
Chmielewski Hughes Lewis Patton Tennessen
Coleman Humphrey Lord Perpich, G. Thorup
Conzemius Jensen McCutcheon  Pillsbury Ueland
Davies Keefe, J. Milton Purfeerst Wegener
Doty Keefe, 5, North Renneke

Dunn Kirchner Novak Schaaf

So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

CALL OF THE SENATE

Mr. Laufenburger imposed a call of the Senate for the re-
mainder of the Senate Calendar. The following Senators answered
to their names:



105TH DAY] THURSDAY, MARCH 14, 1974 5261

Anderson Dunn Kirchner Novak Solon
Arnold Fitzsimons Kleinbaum Ogdahl Spear
Bang Frederick Knutson Olhoft Stassen
Berg Gearty Kowalczyk Olson, A. G.  Stokowski
Bernhagen Hansen, Baldy Krieger Olson, H. D. Tennessen
Borden Hansen, Mel Larson Olson, J. L. Thorup
Chenoweth Hanson, R. Laufenburger Patton Ueland
Chmiclewski Hughes Lewis Perpich, G. Willet
Coleman Humphrey Lord Pilisbury

Conzemius Jensen McCutcheon Purfeerst

Davies Josefson Milton Renneke

Doty Keefe, S. North Schrom

The Sergeant-at-Arms was instructed to bring in the absent
members.

THIRD READING OF SENATE BILLS—CONTINUED

S. F. No. 1999: A bill for an act relating to tax levies for county
road and bridge purposes in St. Louis county.

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage,
The question being taken on the passage of the bill,

And the roll being called, there were yeas 52 and nays 9, as
follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Anderson Doty Knutson Novak Solon
Arnold Fitzsimons Kowalczyk Ogdahl Stassen
Bang Gearty Krieger Olson, H.D.  Stokowski
Berg Hansen, Baldy Larson Olson, J. L. Tennessen
Borden Hansen, Mel Laufenburger O’Neill Thorup
Brown Hanson, R. Lewis Patton Ueland
Chenoweth Hughes Lord. Perpich, G. Wegener
Chmielewski Humphrey McCutcheon  Pillsbury Willet
Coleman Jensen Milton Purfeerst

Conzemius Kirchner Nelson Schrom

Davies Kleinbaum North Sillers

Those who voted in the negative were:

Bernhagen Frederick Keefe, S. Olson, A.G.  Spear
Dunn Josefson Olhoft Renneke

So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

S. F. No. 1769: A bill for an act relating to the practice of
chiropractic; preseribing minimum academic requirements for
licensure and renewal of licensure; amending Minnesota Statutes
1971, Section 148.06.

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.
The question being taken on the passage of the bill,

And the roll being called, there were yeas 61 and nays 1, as
follows:



5262 JOURNAL OF THE SENATE {105TH DAY

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Anderson Dunn Kirchner QOgdahl Solon
Arnold Fitzsimons Kleinbaum Olhoft Spear
Bang Frederick Knutson Olson, A. G.  Stassen
Berg" Gearty Kowalczyk Olson, J. L. Stokowski
Bernhagen Hansen, Baldy Krieger O’Neill Tennessen
Borden Hansen, Me! Jarson Fatton Thorup
Brown Harson, R. Laufenburger Perpich, G. Ueland
Chenoweth Hughes Lord Pillsbury Wegener
Chmielewski Humphrey McCutcheon Purfeerst Willet
Coleman Jensen Milton Renncke

Conzemius Josefson Nelson Schaaf

Davies Keefe, J. North Schrom

Doty Keefe, S. Novak Gillers

Mr. Lewis voted in the negative.
So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

S. F. No. 2731: A bill for an act relating to employment services;
unemployment compensation; benefits; excluding from the term
“employment” services performed by certain employees and ap-
pointees of political subdivisions; amending Minnesota Statutes,
1973 Supplement, Section 268.04, Subdivision 12.

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.
The question being taken on the passage of the bill,

And the roll being called, there were yeas 63 and nays 1, as
follows;

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Anderson Doty Keefe, S. North Schaaf
Arnold Dunn Kirchner Novak Schrom
Ashbach Fitzsimons Kleinbaum Ogdahl Sillers
Bang Frederick Knuison Qlhoft Solon
Berg Gearty Kowalczyk Olson, A. G. Stassen
Bernhagen Hansen, Baldy Krieger Olson, H.D. Stokowski
Borden Hansen, Mel Larson QOlson, J. L. Tennessen
Brown Hanszon, R, Laufenburger (Neill Thorup
Chenoweth Hughes Lewis Patton Ueland
Chmielewski Humphrey Lord Perpich, G. Wegener
Coleman Jensen MeCutcheon  Pillsbury Willet
Conzemius Josefson Milton Purfeerst

Davies Keefe, J. Nelson Renneke

Mr. Spear voted in the negative.

So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

S. F. No, 1963: A bill for an act relating to small loans; increas-
ing the maximum limit on loans; providing charges for examina-

tion; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Sections 56.13, Subdivi-
sions 1 and 5; and 56.15, Subdivision 1.

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.
The question being taken on the passage of the hill,

And the roll being called, there were yeas 50 and nays 10, as
follows:



105TH DAY] THURSDAY, MARCH 14, 1974 5263

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Anderson Fitzsimons Kirchner Nelson Purfeerst
Arnold Frederick Kleinbaum North Schrom
Ashbach Geaity Knutson Ogdahl Sillers
Bang Hansen, Baldy Kowalezyk Olson, A. G. Solon
Berg Hansen, Mel Krieger Olson, H. D. Spear
Bernhagen Hanson, R. Larson Olson, J. L. Stassen
Chenoweth Hughes Laufenburger 0O'Neill Thorup
Chmielewski Josefson Lewis Patton. Ueland
Conzemius Keefe, J. McCutcheon Perpich, G. Wegener
Dunn Keefe, S. Milton Fillsbury Willet

Those who voted in the negative were;

Borden Davies Humphrey Lord Renneke
Brown Doty Jensen Olhoft Tennessen

So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

S. F. No. 3257: A bill for an act relating to highway traffic regu-
lations; requiring certain motor vehicles to be equipped with safety
belts; requiring operators and certain passengers of such motor
vehicles to use safety belts with certain exceptions; prescribing
penalties; suspending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section 169.685,
Subdivisions 1, 2 and 3 for a specified period of time,

‘Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.
The question being taken on the passage of the hill,

And the roll being called, there were yeas 37 and nays 27, as
follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were;

Anderson Davies Keefe, J. Novak Solon
Bang Doty Keofe, 8. Cgdahl Spear
Borden Frederick Lauafenburger Olhoft Stokowski
Brown Gearty Lewis Olson, H.D. Tennessen
Chenoweth Hansen, Mel Lord O'Neill Thorup
Chmielewski Hughes McCutcheon Purfeerst

Coleman Humphrey Milton Cchaaf

Conzemius Josefson North Cillers

Those who voted in the negative were:

Arnold Hansen, Baldy Kowalczyk Patton Ueland
Ashbach Hanszon, R. Krieger Perpich, G. Wegener
Berg Jensen Larson Pillsbury Willet
Bernhagen Kirchner Nelson Renneke

Dunn Kleinbaum Olson, A. G. Schrom

Fitzsimons Knutson Olson, J. L. Stassen

So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

S. F. No. 3198: A bill for an act relating to tax forfeited lands;
providing conditions for the sale of tax forfeited riparian lands;
amctlandin(g] ISVIinnesota Statutes, 1973 Supplement, Sections 9.071
and 282.018.

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.
The question being taken on the passage of the bill,



5264 JOURNAL OF THE SENATE [105TH DAY

And the roll being called, there were yeas 60 and nays 0, as
follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Anderson Davies Kirchner North Renneke
Arnold Dunn Kleinbaum Novak Schaaf
Ashbach Frederick Knutson Ogdahl Schrom
Bang Gearty Kowalczyk Othoft Sillers
Berg Hansen, Mel Krieger Olegon, A. G.  Solon
Bernhagen Hanson, R. Larson Olson, H. D. Spear
Borden Hughes Laufenburger Olson, J. L. Stassen
Brown Humphrey Lewis O'Neill Tennessen
Chenoweth Jensen Lord Patton Thorup
Chmielewski Josefson McCutcheon Perpich, G. Ueland
Coleman Keefe, d. Milton Pillsbury Wegener
Conzemius Keefe, S. Nelson Purfeerst Willet

So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

S. F. No. 3181: A bill for an act relating to game and fish;
authorizing use of portable fish houses within the boundary
walers canoe area,

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.
The question being taken on the passage of the bill,

And the roll being called, there were yeas 50 and nays 9, as
follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Anderson Davies Kleinbaum North Schaaf
Arncld Frederick Kowalczyk Ogdahl Schrom
Ashbach Gearty Krieger Olson, A. G.  Sillers
Bang Hanson, R. Larson Olson, H.D. Solon
Berg Hughes Laufenburger O'Neill Stassen
Bernhagen Humphrey Lewis Patton Tennessen
Brown Jensen Lord Perpich, G. Thorup
Chmielewski Josefson McCutcheon  Pillsbury Ueland
Coleman Keefe, J. Milton Purfeerst Wegener
Conzemius Keefe, S. Nelson Renneke Willet
Those who voted in the negative were:
Borden Dunn Kirchner Olhoft Spear
Chenoweth Hansen, Mel Knutson Qlson, J. L.

So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

S. F. No. 3194: A bill for an act relating to agriculture; licens-
ing of livestock marketing agencies and livestock dealers; requir-
ing bonds and providing for claims against bonds; requiring
records and providing for inspection thereof; requiring livestock
weighers and providing for a weighing service; providing penal-
ties; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section 239.27; repeal-
ing Minnesota Statutes 1971, Sections 239.05, Subdivisions 2, 8,
4, 5, and 6; 239.13; 239.14; 239.15; 239.16; 239.17; 239.18, as
amended; 239.19; 239.21; 239.225; and 23%.26.

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.
The question being taken on the passage of the bill,



105TH DAY]

THURSDAY, MARCH 14, 1974

5265

And the roll being called, there were yeas 58 and nays 0, as

follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Anderson
Arnold
Ashbach
Bang

Berg
Bernhagen
Borden
Brown
Chenoweth
Chmielewski
Coleman
Conzemius

Davies
Dunn
Frederick
Gearty

Hansen, Mel

Hanson, R,
Hughes
Humphrey
Jensen
Josefson
Keefe, J.
Keefe, S.

Kirchner
Kleinbaum
Knutson
Kowalczyk
Krieger
Larson

Laufenburger

Lewis

Lord
McCutcheon
Milton
Nelson

North

Perpich, G.
Fillsbury
Purfeerst
Renneke

So the bill passed and its titie was agreed fo.

8. F. No. 3407: A bill for an act relating to agriculture; local
pest control; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section 18.022,
Subdivision 1.

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.
The question being taken on the passage of the bill,
And the roll being called, there were yeas 58 and nays 0, as

follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Anderson
Arnold
Ashbach
Bang

Berg
Bernhagen
Borden
Brown
Chenoweth
Chmielewski
Coleman
Conzemius

Davies
Dunn
Frederick
Gearty
Hansen, Mel
Hanson, R.
Hughes
Humphrey
Jengen
Josefson
Keefe, J.
Keefe, S.

Kirchner
Kleinbaum
Knutson
Kowalczyk
Krieger
Larson

Laufenburger

Lewis
Lord
Milton
Nelson
North

Novak
0~xdahl
Olhoft
Clson, A. G.
Qlson, H. D.
Olson, J. L.
O’Neiil
Patton
Perpich, G.
Pillsbury
Purieerst
Renneke

So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

Schaaf
Schrom
Sillers
Spear
Stasscn
Tennessen
Thorup
Ueland
Wegener
Willet

Schaaf
Schrom
Sillers
Spear
Stassen
Tennessen
Thoru
Uelan
Wegener
Willet

S. F. No. 2003: A bill for an act relating to education; approval
of plans for school buildings; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971,
Section 21.15,

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.

The question being taken on the passage of the hill,

And the roll being called, there were yeas 86 and nays 22, as

follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Anderson
Arnold
Bang
Brown
Chenoweth
Coleman
Conzemius
Davies

Fitzsimons
Gearty
Hansen, Mel
Hughes
Humphrey
Josefson
Keefe, J.
Keefe, S.

Kirchner
Laufenburger
Lewis

Lord
McCutcheon
Milton
Nelson

North

Novak
Oilson, J. L.
O’Neill
Pillsbury
Schaaf
Sillers
Spear
Stassen

Tennessen
Thorup
Ueland
Wegener



5266 JOURNAL OF THE SENATE [105TH DAY

Those who voted in the negative were:

Ashbach Dunn Kowalczyk Olson, H.D. Schrom
Berg Frederick Krieger Patton Willet
Bernhagen Hanson, R. Larzon Perpich, G.

Borden Jensen Olhoft Purfeerst

Chmielewski Knutson Olson, A. G. Renneke

So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

S. F. No. 2110: A bill for an act relating to metropolitan
government; providing for the establishment of standards for
the regulation of the subdivision, use and development of land
and water; providing for adoption of ordinances therefor.

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.
The question being taken on the passage of the bill,

Mr. Renneke moved that those not voting be excused from
voting. The motion did not prevail.

Mr. Milton moved that those not voting be excused from voting.
The motion prevailed.

And the roll being called, there were yeas 36 and nays 27, as
follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Bang Hansen, Baldy Laufenburger Olhoft Spear
Borden Hansen, Mel Lewis Olson, A. G.  Stokowski
Chenoweth Hughes Lord Olson, H. D. Tennessen
Coleman Humphrey McCutcheon O’Neill Wegener
Conzemius Keefe, J. Milton Perpich, G.

Davies Keofe, S, Nelson Schaaf

Doty Kirchner North Schrom

Gearty Kleinbaum Novak Solon

Those who voted in the negative were:
Anderson Dunn Knutson Patton Thorup

Arnold Fitzsimons Kowalezyk Pillsbury Ueland
Berg Frederick Krieger Purfeerst Willet
Bernhagen Hanson, R. J.arson Renneke

Brown Jensen Ogdahl Sillers

Chmielewski Josefson Olson, J. L. Stassen

So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

8. F. No. 3477: A bill for an act relating to Minnesota Statutes;
providing for the correction or erroneous, ambiguous, omitted,
unconstitutional and obsolete references and text; eliminating
certain dupliciious and conflicting provisions superseded by or
conflicting with other provisions of law; amending Minnesota
Statutes 1971, Sections 3.85, Subdivision 9; 3.925; 6.18; 7.05;
15.38; 16.01; 17.10; 31.495, Subdivisions 4 and 5; 35.605, Sub-
division 1; 43.24, Subdivision 2, as amended; 84.03; 85A.02, Sub-
division 12; 86.11, Subdivision 5; 94.09, Subdivision 5; 115.42;
116.03, Subdivision 1; 122.02; 122.22, Subdivision 1; 122.23, Sub-
division 1; 123.015; 124.76; 126.021; 136.601, Subdivisions 1 and
2: 136.62, Subdivision 4; 136.621, Subdivision 2; 136A.07; 144.71,



105TH DAY] THURSDAY, MARCH 14, 1974 5267

Subdivision 3; 148.41; 14875; 152,19, Subdivision 6; 154.16;
168.012, Subdivision 1, as amended; 168.013, Subdivisions 1g as
amended, 2, 12 as amended, and 14; 168.014, as amended; 168.11,
Subdivision 2; 169.123, Subdivisions 1, 2 as amended, 4, and 6;
169.205, Subdivision 1; 175.171; 176.131, Subdivision 1; 183.51,
Subdivision 12; 215.22; 215.24; 252.24, Subdivision 1; 252.27,
Subdivision 2; 260.251, Subdivision 3; 270.06; 326.241, Sub-
division 3, as amended ; 360.015, Subdivision 17; 362.15; 473A.12;
473B.04; 481.02, Subdivision 2; 482.09; 487.03, Subdivision 2, as
amended; 517.03; 626A.17, Subdivision 3; Minnesota Statutes,
1973 Supplement, Sections 4.12, Subdivision 2; 80B.01, Subdivi-
sions 8 and 9; 80B.02, Subdivision 1; 80B.03, Subdivision 5;
80B.06, Subdivision 5; 80B.07, Subdivision 1; 80B.13; 290.031,
Subdivision 2; 290.0618; 2908.22, Subdivision 2; 363.05, Subdivi-
sion 1; 412.018, Subdivision 1; Laws 1973, Chapters 561, Section
1, Subdivision 2; 628, Section 1, Subdivision 2; 638, Sections 62,
63, Subdivisions 1 and 3; 65, 67, and 68; 721, Section 8, Subdivi-
sion 7; and 744, Section 4, Subdivision 10; repealing Minnesota
Statutes 1971, Section 471.47; Laws 1971, Chapters 680, Section
2; and 695, Section 6, Subdivision 3; Laws 1973, Chapters 35,
Section 28; 54; 68, Sections 1 and 5; 83; 94, Section 4; 569, Sec-
tion 5; 638, Sections 59 and 60; 676, Section 31; 725, Sections 3,
16, and 18; and 754, Section 7.

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.
The question being taken on the passage of the bill,

And the roll being called, there were yeas 63 and nays 0, as
follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Anderson Dunn Kirchner Novak Schrom
Arnold Fitzsimons Kleinbaum QOgdahl Sillers
Ashbach Frederick Knutson Olhoft Solon
Bang Gearty Kowalcezyk Olson, A. G. Spear
Berg Hansen, Baldy Krieger Qlson, H D. Stassen
Bernhagen Hansen, Mel Larson Olson, J. L. Stokowski
Borden Hanson, R. Laufenburger 'Neill Tennessen
Brown Hughes Lewis Patton Thorup
Chenoweth Humphrey Lord Perpich, G. Ueland
Chmielewski Jensen MecCuteheon  Pillsbury Wegener
Coleman Joselson Milton Purfeerst Willet
Conzemius Keefe, J. Nelson Renncke

Doty Keefe, S. North Schaaf

So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

S. F. No. 2580: A bill for an act relating to education; estab-
lishing grounds and procedures for the suspension, exclusion, and
expulsion of public school pupils; repealing Minnesota Statutes
1971, Section 127.071.

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage,
The question being taken on the passage of the bill,

" And the roll being called, there were yeas 54 and nays 9, as
follows:



5268 JOURNAL OF THE SENATE [105TH DAY

'I"hose who voted in the affirmative were:

Arnold Davies Keefe, S. North Schrom
Ashbach Doty Kirchner Novak Sillers
Bang Dunn Kleinbaum Ogdahl Solon
Berg Fitzsimons Kowalczyk Olhoft Spear
Bernhagen Frederick Larson Olson, H. D. Stassen
Borden Gearty Laufenburger Olson, J. L. Stokowski
Brown Hansen, Mel Lewis O’'Neill Tennessen
Chenoweth Hanson, R. Lord Perpich, G. Ueland
Chmielewski Hughes MecCuatcheon Pillshury Wegener
Coleman Humphrey Milton Purfeerst Willet
Conzemius Keefe, J. Nelson Schaaf

Those who voted in the negative were:

Anderson Jensen Knutson Patton Thorup
Hansen, Baldy Josefson Olson, A. G. Renneke

So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

S. F. No. 3434: A bill for an act relating to registration of voters;
voter registration in political subdivisions without permanent regis-
tration as of July 1, 1973; registration cards; amending Minnesota
Statutes, 1973 Supplement, Section 201.061, by adding a subdi-
vision.

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.

The question being taken on the passage of the bill,

And the roll being called, there were yeas 63 and nays 0, as
follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Anderson Doty Keafe, S. North Schaaf
Arnold Dunn Kirchner Novak Sillers
Ashbach Fitzsimons Kleinbaum Ogdahl Solon
Bang Frederick Knutson Olhoft Spear
Berg Gearty Kowalezyk Olson, A. G. Stassen
Bernhagen Hansen, Baldy Krieger Olson, H.I).  Stokowski
Borden Hansen, Mel Larson Olson, J. L. Tennessen
Brown Hanson, R. Laufenburger (’Neill Thorup
Chenoweth Hughes Lewisa Patton Ueland
Chmielewski Humphrey Lord Perpich, G. Wegener
Coleman Jensen McCutcheon Pillshury Willet
Conzemius Josefson Milton Purfeerst

Davies Keefe, J. Nelson Rennecke

So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

S. F. No. 2386: A bill for an act relating to enforcement of child
support orders; amending Minnesota Statutes, 1973 Supplement,
Section 393.07, Subdivision 9.

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.
The question being taken on the passage of the bill,

And the roll being called, there were yeas 62 and nays 0, as
follows:



105TH DAY] THURSDAY, MARCH 14, 1974 5269

Those who voted in the afirmative were:

Anderson Dunn Kirchner Novak Schrom
Arnold Fitzsimons Kleinbaum QOgdahl Sillers
Ashbach Frederick Knutson Olhoft Solon
Bang Gearty Kowalczyk Olson, A.G. Spear
Berg Hansen, Baldy Krieger Olson, H.D. Stassen
Bernhagen Hansen, Mel Larson Olson, J. L. Stokowski
Borden Hanson, R. Laufenburger (¥Neiil Thorup
Brown Hughes Lewis Patton Ueland
Chenoweth Humphrey Tord Perpich, G. Wegener
Chmielewski Jensen McCutcheon Pillsbury Willet
Conzemius Josefson Milton Purfeerst

Davies Keefe, J. Nelson Renneke

Doty Keefe, S, North Schaaf

So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

S. F. No, 2315: A bill for an act relating to metropolitan gov-
ernment; creating a metropolitan sports commission and prescrib-
ing its powers and duties.

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.
The question being taken on the passage of the bill,

And the roll being called, there were yeas 47 and nays 15, as
follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Anderson Dunn Kirchner Olson, H.D. Solon
Arnold Fitzsimons Kleinbaum Olson, J. L. Stassen
Bang Frederick Krieger O’Neill Stokowski
Berg Gearty Larson Patton Thoru,
Bernhagen Hansen, Mel Laufenburger Perpich, G. Uelan
Brown Hanson, R. McCutcheon Pilisbury Wegener
Chenoweth Hughes Milton Purfeerst Willet
Chmielewski Humphrey Nelson Renneke

Coleman Jensen North Schaaf

Doty Keefe, J. Novak Sillers

Those who voted in the negative were:

Borden Josefson Kowalczyk Ogdahl Schrom
Conzemius Keefe, 8. Lewis Olhoft Spear
Hansen, Baldy Knutson Lord Olson, A. G. Tennessen

So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

S. F. No. 2964: A bill for an act relating to welfare; alcohol and
drug abuse; establishing an office of native American programs
within the state authonty on alcohol and drug abuse; appropriat-
ing money; amending Minnesota Statutes, 1973 Supplement Sec-
tion 254A.03.

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.
The question being taken on the passage of the bill,

And the roll being called, there were veas 56 and nays 1, as
follows:



5270 JOURNAL OF THE SENATE [105TH DAY

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Anderson Doty Kleinbaum Novak Solon
Arnold Dunn Knutson Ogdahl Spear
Ashbach Fitzsimons Kowalczyk Olhoft Stassen
Bang Frederick Krieger Olson, A. G.  Stokowski
Berg Gearty Larson Olson, J. L. Thorup
Borden Hansen, Mel Laufenburger Q’Neill Ueland
Brown Hanson, R. Lewis Perpich, G. Wegener
Chenoweth Hughes Lord Pillsbury Willet
Chmielewski Josefson McCutcheon Purfeerst

Coleman Keefe, J. Milton Schaaf

Conzemius Keefe, S. Nelson Schrom

Davies Kirchner North Sillers

Mr. Hansen, Baldy voted in the negative.
So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

S. F. No. 2669: A bill for an act relating to the state planning
agency; creating the position of state demographer; prescribing
duties; appropriating moneys therefor; amending Minnesota Stat-
utes 1971, Sections 4.11, by adding a subdivision; and 4.12, by
adding subdivisions.

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.

The question being taken on the passage of the bill,

And the roll being called, there were yeas 58 and nays 1, as
follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Anderson Dunn Kirchner Novak Sillers
Arnold Fitzsimons Kleinzhaum Cgdakl Solon
Ashbach Frederick Knutson Olhoft Spear
Bang Gearty Kowalczyk Olson, A.G.  Stassen
Berg Hansen, Baldy Krieger Olson, J. L. Stokowski
Borden Hansen, M¢! FLarson O'Neill Tennesgen
Brown Hansoen, R, Laufenburger Patton Thory
Chenoweth Hughes Tewis Perpich, G. Uelan
Chmielewski Jensen Lord Pilisbury Wegener
Celeman Josefson Milton Purfeerst Willet
Conzemius Keefe, J. Nelson Renneke

Davies Keefe, S, North Schaaf

Mr. Doty voted in the negative,
So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

S. F. No. 2670: A bill for an act relating to economic develop-
ment; restrictions upon public relations expenditures by the de-
partment of economic development; amending Laws 1973, Chap-
ter 720, Section 31, Subdivision 2.

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.
The question being taken on the passage of the bill,

And the roll being called, there were yeas 47 and nays 12, as
follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Anderson Chmielewski Gearty Josefson Kowalczyk
Arnold Coleman Hansen, Baldy Keefe, J. Krieger

Berg Conzemius Hanson, R. Keefe, S. Larson
Borden Davies Hughes Kirchner Laufenburger

Chenoweth Fitzsimons Jensen Kleinbaum Lewis



105TH DAY] THURSDAY, MARCH 14, 1974 5271
Lord Ogdahl Patton Spear Wegener
Milton Olhoft Perpich, G. Stokowski Willet
Nelson QOlson, A. G.  Purfeerst Tennessen
North Qlson, J. L. Schaaf Thorup
Novak O’'Neill Cillers Ueland
Those who voted in the negative were:
Ashbach Doty Hansen, Mel Pillsbury Solon
Bang Dunn Knutson Renneke Stassen
Brown Frederick

So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

S. F. No. 2161: A bhill for an act relating to mebile homes; pro-
viding for licensing and bonding of manufacturers and dealers and
requirements for installation of mobile homes; providing penalties;
amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Sections 327.31, Subdivision
3, and by adding subdivisions; 327.32, Subdivision 5, and by add-
ing a subdivision; 327.33, Subdivision 2; 327.34, Subdivisions 1
and 3, and by adding a subdivision; 168.011, Subdivision 4; 168.27,
Subdivision 1; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Chapter 327
by adding a section.

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.
The question being taken on the passage of the bill,

And the roll being called, there were yeas 59 and nays 0, as
follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Anderson Doty Keefe, S. North Schaaf
Arnoid Duim Kirchner Novak Sillers
Ashbach Fitzsimons Kleinbaum Ogdahl Solon
Bang Frederick Knutson Olhoft Spear
Berg Gearty Kowalezyk Olson, A. G. Stassen
Borden Hansen, Baldy Krieger Olson, J. L. Stokowski
Brown Hansen, Mel Larson O’Neill Tennessen
Chenoweth Hanson, R. Laufenburger Patton Thoru,
Chmielewski Hughes Lewis Perpich, G. Uelan
Coleman Jensen Lord Pillsbury Wegener
Conzemius Josefson Milton Purfeerst Willet
Davies Keefe, J. Nelson Renneke

So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

MOTIONS AND RESOLUTIONS—CONTINUED

Mr. Coleman moved to take up the Calendar of Ordinary Mat-
ters at this time, remaining on the Order of Business of Motions
and Resclutions. The motion prevailed.

SUSPENSION OF RULES

Mr. Coleman moved that the Rules of the Senate be so far sus-
pended as to waive the lie-over requirement on Senate Files and
House Files on the Calendar of Ordinary Matters. The motion
prevailed.

CALENDAR OF ORDINARY MATTERS

S. . No. 2748: A bill for an act relating to public health in the
towns of Moose Lake in Carlton county and Windemere in Pine
county; providing for the creation of a sewer district and a sanitary
sewer board to administer the distriet; providing for the collection,



5272 JOURNAL OF THE SENATE [105TH DAY

treatment, and disposal of sewage in the Moose Lake and Winde-
mere area.

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.
The question being taken on the passage of the bill,

And the roll being called, there were yeas 49 and nays 6, as
follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Arnold Frederick Kirchner North Solon
Ashbach Gearty Kleinbaum Novak Spear
Bang Hansen, Baldy Knutson Ogdahl Stassen
Berg Hansen, Mel Kowalczyk Olson, J. L. Stokowski
Brown Hanson, R. Krieger O’Neill Tennessen
Chmielewski Hughes Larson Patton Thorup
Conzemius Jensen Laufenburger Pillsbury Ueland
Davies Josefson Lewis Purfeerst Wegener
Doty Keefe, J. Lord Schaaf Willet
Fitzsimons Keefe, 5. Nelson Sillers

Those who voted in the negative were:

Anderson Olhoft Olson, A. G.  Perpich, G. Renneke
Dunn

So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

S. F. No. 3088: A bill for an act relating to courts, Ramsey coun-
ty; amending Minnesota Statutes, 1973 Supplement, Sections
488A.18, Subdivisions 10 and 13; 488A.20, Subdivisions 1, 2, 4, and
6; 488A.22, Subdivision 3; 488A.281; 488A.283; 488A.285, Subdi-
visions 1 and 2; 488A.286; 488A.30, Subdivisions 1, 2, and 4; Min-
nesota Statutes 1971, Sections 485A.18, Subdivsion 11; 488A.19,
Subdivisions 6, 8, and 10; 488A.20, Subdivisions 3 and 7; 488A.21,
Subdivision 1; 488A.23, Subdivision 1; 488A.26, Subdivisions 1, 3,
4, and 7; 488A.27, Subdivisions 3 and 7; 488A.30, Subdivision 3;
488A.31, Subdivisions 1 and 5; 488A.34, Subdivisions 2, 3, 4, 6, 9,
and 12; repealing Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section 488A.23, Sub-
divisions 3 and 4.

With the unanimous consent of the Senate, Mr. O’Neill moved
to amend S. F. No. 3088, as follows:

Page 9, after line 27, insert:

“Sec. 15. Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section 484.18, Subdivision
3, is amended to read:

Subd. 3. In Chisago county: On the first Tuesday in May
April and the first Tuesday in Deesmber November.”

Page 27, line 13, strike “39” and insert “41”

Renumber the sections in sequence
Further, amend the title as follows:

Line 2, strike “county” and insert “and Chisago counties”
Line 10, after “Sections” insert “484.18, Subdivision 3;”
The maotion prevailed. So the amendment was adopted.

S. F. No. 3088 was read the third time, as amended, and placed
on its final passage.



105TH DAY] THURSDAY, MARCH 14, 1974 5273

The question being taken on the passage of the bill, as amended,

And the roll being called, there were yeas 54 and nays 0, as
follows:

" Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Anderson Conzemius Josefson Ogdahl Sillers
Arnold Davies Keefe, J. Olhoft Solon
Ashbach Doty Keefe, S. Olson, A. G. Spear
Bang Dunn Knutson Olson, J. L. Stassen
Berg Fitzsimons Krieger O’Neill Stokowski
Bernhagen Frederick Larson Patton, Tennessen
Borden Gearty Laufenburger Perpich, G. Thorup
Brown Hansen, Baldy Lord Pillsbury Ueland
Chenoweth Hanson, R. Nelson Purfeerst Wegener
Chmielewski Hughes North Renneke Willet
Coleman Jensen Novak Schaaf

So the bill passed, as amended, and its title was agreed to.

H. F. No. 2833: A bill for an act relating to the appointment of
a law clerk for the district judge assigned to hold court in the
counties of Rice, Steele and Waseca; setting the salary thereof;
amending Laws 1967, Chapter 355, Section 1, Subdivision 2.

‘Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.

And the roll being called, there were yeas 58 and nays 0, as
follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Anderson Doty Keefe, J. Novak Sillers
Arnold Dunn Keefe, S. QOgdahl Solon
Ashbach Fitzsimons Knutson Olhoft ! Spear
Bang Frederick Kowalezyk Olson, H. D. Stassen
Berg Gearty Krieger Qlson, J. L. Stokowski
Bernhagen Hansen, Baldy Larson O’'Neill Tennessen
Borden Hansen, Mel Laufenburger Pation Thorup
Brown Hanson, R. Lewis Perpich, G, Ueland
Chmielewski Hughes Lord Pillsbury Wegener
Coleman Humphrey Milton Purfeerst Willet
Conzemius Jensen Nelson Renneke

Davies Josefson North Schaaf

So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

H. I, No. 2588: A bill for an act relating to peace officers;
defining peace officer to include reserve police officers and re-
serve deputy sheriffs; amending Laws 1973, Chapter 248, Section
1, Subdivision 2.

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.
The question being taken on the passage of the bill,

And the roll being called, there were yeas 59 and nays 0, as
follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Anderson Chmielewsgki Gearty Keefe, J. Lord

Arnold Coleman Hansen, Baldy Keefe, S. MecCutcheon
Ashbach Conzemius Hansen, Mel Knutson Milton
Bang Davies Hanson, R. Kowalezyk Nelson

Berg Doty Hughes Krieger North
Bernhagen Dunn Humphrey Larson Novak
Borden Fitzsimons Jensen Laufenburger Ogdahl

Brown Frederick Josefson Lewis Olhoft



5274 JOURNAL OF THE SENATE
Olson, A.G. Patton Renneke Solon
Olson, H.D. Perpich, G, Schaaf Spear
QOlson, J. L. Pillsbury Schrom Stassen
O'Neill Purfeerst Sillers Stokowski

So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

H. F. No. 1967: A bill for an act relating to the library board
authorizing compensation for

of the city of Minneapolis;
members.

[105TH DAY

Thorup
Ueland
Willet

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.
The question being taken on the passage of the hill,

And the roll being called, there were yeas 51 and nays 9, as

follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:
Anderson Davies Keefe, S. Ogdahl
Arnold Doty Knutson Olhoft
Ashbach Dunn Krieger Olson, A. G.
Bang Fitzsimons Larson Olson, H. D.

g Frederick Laufenburger Olson, J. L.
Bernhagen Gearty Lewis O’Neill
Brown Hansen, Mel Lord Patton
Chenoweth Hanson, R. MecCutcheon  Pillsbury
Chmielewski Hughes Milton Purfeerst
Coleman Humphrey North Schaaf
Conzemius Jensen Novak Solon

Those who voted in the negative were:

Hansen, Baldy Keefe, J. Nelson
Jogefson Kowalezyk Perpich, G.

So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

Renneke
Schrom

Spear
Stassen
Stokowski
Tennessen
Thoru
Uelan
Willet

Sillers

H. F. No. 1966: A hill for an act relating to the city of Minnea-
polis; authorizing compensation for members of the board of park
commissioners.

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.
The question being taken on the passage of the bill,
And the roll being ealled, there were yeas 53 and nays 5, as

follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:
Anderson Doty Knutson QOgdahl Sillers
Arnold Dunn Krieger QOlhoft Solon
Ashbach Fitzsimons Larson Olson, A, G.  Spear
Bang Frederick Laufenburger QOlson, H. D. Stassen
Berg Gearty Lewis Olson, J. L. Stokowski
Bernhagen Hansen, Mel Lord O’Neill Tennessen
Brown Hanson, R. McCutcheon Patton Thorup
Chenoweth Hughes Milton Pilisbury Ueland
Chmielewski Humphrey Nelson Purfeerst Willet
Coleman Jensen North Renneke
Conzemius Keefe, S Novak Schaaf

Those who voted in the negative were:
Hansen, Baldy Josefson Keefe, J. Perpich, G. Schrom

So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

H. F. No. 2595: A bill for an act relating to the Minnehaha
ereek watershed district; providing for the establishment of a



105TH DAY] THURSDAY, MARCH 14, 1974 5275

district water maintenance and repair fund; authorizing a tax
levy for water maintenance and repair purposes,

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.
The question being taken on the passage of the bill,

And the rell being called, there were yeas 61 and nays 0, as
follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Anderson Fitzsimons Kleinbaum Oegdahl Solon
Arnold Frederick Knutson Olhoft Spear
Ashbach Gearty Kowaleczyk Olson, A. G.  Stassen
Bang Hansen, Baldy Krieger Olson, H.D.  Stokowski
Berg Hansen, Mel ILarson Olson, J. L. Tennessen
Bernhagen Hanson, R. Laufenburger O’Neill Thorup
Brown Hughes Lewis Patton Ueland
Chenoweth Humphrey Lord Perpich, G. Wegener
Chmielewski Jensen MeCutcheon  Pillsbury Wiilet
Coleman Josefson Milton Purfeerst

Conzemius Keefe, J. Nelson Schaaf

Davies Keefe, S, North Schrom

Doty Kirchner Novak Stllers

So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

H. F. No. 1952: A bill for an act relating to the construction,
maintenance and repair of county ditches in Ramsey county;
repealing Laws 1957, Chapter 682.

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.

The question being taken on the passage of the bill,

And the roll being called, there were yeas 63 and nays 0, as
follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Anderson Doty Keefe, S. Novak Schrom
Arnold Dunn Kirchner Ogdahl Sillers
Ashbach Fitzsimons Knutson Olhoft Solon
Bang Frederick Kowalczyk Olson, A.G.  Spear
Berg Gearty Krieger Olson, H. D. Stassen
Bernhagen Hansen, Baldy Larson Olson, J. L. Stokowski
Borden Hansen, Mel Laufenburger O'Neill Fennessen
Brown Hanson, R. Lewis Patton Thorup
Chenoweth Hughes Lor? Perpich, G. Ueland
Chmielewski Humphrey McCutcheon Pillsbury Wegener
Coleman Jensen Milton Purfeerst Willet
Conzemiuz Josefson Nelson Renneke

Davies Keefe, J. North Schaaf

So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

H. F. No. 2144: A bill for an act relating to wild animals;
affording protection to the wolverine; providing a penalty;
amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Seetion 97.55, Subdivision 8;
and 100,27, Subdivision 1.

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.
The question being taken on the passage of the hill,

And the roll being called, there were yeas 63 and nays 1, as
follows:



5276 JOURNAL OF THE SENATE [105TH DAY

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Anderson Doty Keefe, S. North Schrom
Arnold Dunn Kirchner Novak Sillers
Ashbach Fitzsimons Kleinbaum Ogdahl Solon
Bang Frederick Knutson Olhoft Spear
Berg Gearty Kowalczyk QOlson, A, G.  Stassen
Bernhagen Hansen, Baldy Krieger Olson, H. D. Stokowski
Borden Hansen, Mel Iarson Olson, J. L. Tennessen
Brown Hanson, R. Laufenburger FNeill Thorup
Chenoweth Hughes Lewis Patton Ueland
Chmielewski Humphrey Lord Perpich, G. Wegener
Coleman Jensen MecCutcheon  Pillsbury Willet
Conzemius Josefson Milton Purfeerst

Davies Keefe, J. Nelson Schaaf

Mr. Renneke voted in the negative.
So the bill passed and its title was agreed to,
S. F. No, 3210: A bill for an act relating to taxation; extending

option to employ certified assessor; amending Minnesota Stat-
utes, 1973 Supplement, Section 270.493.

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.
The question being taken on the passage of the bill,

And the roll being called, there were yeas 60 and nays 1, as
follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Anderson Doty Keefe, S. North Renneke
Arnold Dunn Kirchner Novak Schaaf
Ashbach Fitzsimons Knutson Ogdahl Schrom
Bang Frederick Kowalezyk Qlhoft Sillers
Berg Gearty Krieger Olson, A.G. Solon
Bernhagen Hansen, Baldy Larson Olson, H. D. Stasgen
Borden Hansen, Mel Laufenburger Olson,J. L, Stokowski
Brown Hanson, R. Lewis O’'Neill Tennessen
Chenoweth Hughes Lord - Patton Thorup
Coleman Humphrey McCutcheon Perpich, G. Ueland
Conzemius Jensen Milton Pillsbury Wegener
Davies Keefe, J. Nelson Purfeerst Willet

Mr. Chmielewski voted in the negative.
So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

H. F. No. 1402: A bhill for an act relating to the policemen’s
relief association in the city of New Ulm, and membership in the
public employees police and fire fund.

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.
The question being taken on the passage of the bill,

- And the roll being called, there were yeas 64 and nays 0, as
follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Anderson Brown Dunn Hughes Kleinbaum
Arnold Chenoweth Fitzsimons Humphrey Knutson
Ashbach Chmielewski Frederick Jensen Kowalczyk
Bang Coleman Gearty Josefson Krieger

Berg Conzemius Hansen, Baldy Keele, J. Larson
Bernhagen Davies Hansen, Mel Keefe, S. Laufenburger

Borden Doty Hanson, R. Kirchner Lewis



105TH DAY] THURSDAY, MARCH 14, 1974 5277

Lord Qgdahl Patton Schrom Tennessen
McCutcheon Olhoft Perpich, G. Sillers Thom
Milton Olson, A. G.  Pillsbury Solon Uelan
Nelson Qlson, H. D. Purfeerst Spear Wegener
North Olson, J. L. Renneke Stassen Willet
Novak O’Neill Schaaf Stokowski

So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.

RECONSIDERATION

Mr. Purfeerst moved that the vote whereby S. F. No. 3422 failed
to pass the Senate on March 13, 1974, be now reconsidered. The
motion prevailed. So the vote was reconsidered.

CALL OF THE SENATE

Mr. North imposed a call of the Senate. The following Senators
answered to their names:

Anderson Conzemius Keefe, J. Nelson Renneke
Arnold Davies Keefe, S. North Schaaf
Ashbach Doty Kirchner Ogdahl Spear
Bang Fitzsimons Knutzon Olhoft Stassen
Berg Frederick Kowalczyk Olson, A. G. Stokowski
Bernhagen Gearty Krieger Olson, H. D. ‘Tennessen
Borden Hansen, Baldy Laufenburger O'Neill Ueland
Brown Hansen, Mel Lewis Patton Wegener
Chenoweth Hanson, R. Lord Perpich, G. Willet
Chmielewski Jensen McCutcheon Pillsbury

Coleman Josefson Milton Purfeerst

The Sergeant-at-Arms was instructed to bring in the absent
members.

S. F. No. 3422: A bill for an act relating to Ramsey county;
authorizing the board of county commissioners to issue general
obligation bonds for the costs of architectural and professional
services in the construction of an adult detention, and juvenile
center, and security treatment facility at St. Paul-Ramsey hospital.

Was read the third time and placed on its final passage.
The question being taken on the passage of the bill,

And the roll being called, there were yeas 43 and nays 14, as
fcllows:

Those who voted in the afirmative were:

Ashbach Frederick Kleinbaum Nelson Perpich, G.
Bang Gearty Knutson North Purfeerst
Borden Hansen, Mel Kowalczyk Novak Schaaf
Chenoweth Hanson, R. Krieger Ogdahl Solon
Chmielewski Hughes Larson Olhoft Stassen
Coleman Humphrey Laufenburger Olson, A. G. Stokowski
Davies Keeie, J. Lord Oison, H. D. Ueland
Doty Keefe, S. McCutcheon  OFNeill

Fitzsimons Kirchner Milton Patton

Those who voted in the negative were:

Arnold Conzemius Josefson Renneke Wegener
Bernhagen Dunn Lewis Schrom Willet
Brown Hansen, Baldy Olson, J. L. Spear

So the bill passed and its title was agreed to.



5278 JOURNAL OF THE SENATE [105TH DAY

MOTIONS AND RESOLUTIONS—CONTINUED
APPOINTMENTS

Mr. Davies, from the Committee on Committees, recommended
that the following named Senators be and they hereby are ap-
pointed as a Conference Committee on H. F, No. 978, pursuant to
the request of the House:

Messrs. Wegener; Keefe, J.; Humphrey.
‘Mr. Davies moved that the foregoing appointments be ap-
proved. The motion prevailed.

Mr. Davies, from the Committee on Committees, recommended
that the following named Senators be and they hereby are ap-
pointed as a Conference Committee on H. F. No. 3202, pursuant
to the request of the House:

Messrs. Thorup, Anderson, Frederick.
Mr. Davies moved that the foregoing appointments be approved.
The motion prevailed.

MOTIONS AND RESOLUTIONS—CONTINUED

Mr. Coleman moved to take up the General Orders Calendar at
this time, remaining on the Order of Business of Motions and
Resolutions. The motion prevailed.

GENERAL ORDERS

The Senate resolved itself into a Comimittee of the Whole, with
Mr. Patton in the chair.

After some time spent therein, the committee arose, and the
President having resumed the chair, Mr. Patton reported that the
committee had considered S. F. Nos. 2900, 2222, 3455, 1934, 3244,
and 3433 which the committee recommends to pass.

S. F. No. 2059, which the committee recommends to pass with
the following amendment offered by Mr. Perpich, G.:

Amend 8. F. No. 2059 as follows:
Page 3, after line 10, insert:

“Subd. 7. The provisions of this section shall not apply in the
boundary waters canoe area.”

And then, on motion of Mr. Patton, the report of the Committee
of the Whole, as kept by the Secretary, was adopted.

MOTIONS AND RESOLUTIONS—CONTINUED

Mr. Coleman moved that H. F. No. 3242, No. 99 on General
Orders, be stricken and placed on the Calendar of Ordinary Mat-
ters. The motion prevailed.

Mr. Arnold moved that the name of Mr. Perpich, G. be shown
as the chief author and that the name of Mr. Perpich, A. J. be
added as co-author on S. F. No. 2867. The motion prevailed.



105TH DAY] THURSDAY, MARCH 14, 1974 5279

RECONSIDERATION

Mr. McCutcheon moved that the vote whereby S. F. No. 3120
failed to pass the Senate on March 13, 1974, be now reconsidered.

MOTIONS AND RESOLUTIONS—CONTINUED

Mr. Coleman moved that the Senate do now adjourn until 10
o’clock a.m., Friday, March 15, 1974. The motion prevailed.

Patrick E. Flahaven, Secretary of the Senate.





