
112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH 25, 1974

STATE OF MINNESOTA

SIXTY-EIGHTH SESSION - 1974

ONE HUNDRED-TWELFTH DAY

6747

SAINT PAUL, MINNESOTA, MONDAY, MARCH 25,. 1974

The House convened at 10 :00 a.m. and was called to order by
the Speaker.

Prayer was offered by the Chaplain.

The roll was called, and the following members were present:

Adams, J.
Adams, S.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, D..
Anderson, G.
Anderson J I.
Becklin
Belisle
Bell
Bennett
Berg
Berglin
Biersdorf
Braun
Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Carlson, B.
Carlson, D.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Cleary
Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl
DeGroat

Dieterich
Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Eneba
Erdahl
Erickson
Esan
Faricy
Ferderer
Fjoslien
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn .
Hanson
Haugerud
Heinitz
Hook
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson, C.
Johnson, D.
Johnson,J.
JohnsoTI,R.

Jopp Moe
Jude Mueller
Kahn Munger
Kelly Myrah
Kempe Nelson
Klaus Niehaus
Knickerbocker Norton
Knoll Ohnstad
Kostohryz Ojala
Laidig Parish
Larson Patton
LaVoy Pavlak, R.
Lemke Pavlak, R. L.
Lindstrom, E. Pehler
Lindstrom, J. Peterson
Lombardi Pieper
Long Pleasant
Mann Prahl
McArthur Quirin
McCarron Resner
McCauley. Rice
McEachern Ryan
McFarlin St. Onge
McMillan. Salchert
Menke Samuelson
Miller, D. Sarna
Miller, M. Savelkoul

Schreiber
Schulz
Searle
Sherwood
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Skaar
Smith
Spanish
Stangeland
Stanton
Swanson
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vanasek
Vento
Voss
Weaver
Wenzel
Wigley
Wohlwend
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker

A quorum was present.

Graba was excused until 7 :45 p.m. Newcome was excused until
11 :45 a.m. Kvam was excused until 2 :45 p.m.

The Chief Clerk proceeded to read the Journal of the preceding
day, when on the motion of Mr. DeGroat, the further reading
was dispensed with and the Journal was approved as corrected.



6748 JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE

REPORTS OF CHIEF CLERK

[112th Day

Pursuant to Rules of the House, printed copies of H. F. Nos.
560 and 3575 and S. F. Nos. 2707, 2913, 3280 and 3575 have been
placed in the members' files.

PETITIONS AND COMMUNICATIONS

The following communications were received: <

STATE OF MINNESOTA
OFFICE OF THE GOVERNOR

ST. PAUL 55155

March 22, 1974

The Honorable Martin O. Sabo
Speaker of the House

Sir:

I have the honor to inform you that I have received, approved,
signed and deposited in the office of the Secretary of State the
following House File:

H. F. No. 2148, An act relating to financial corporations;
amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section 47.52.

Sincerely,

WENDELL R. ANDERSON
Governor

STATE OF MINNESOTA
OFFICE OF THE SECRETARY OF STATE

ST. PAUL 55155

The Honorable Martin O. Sabo
Speaker of the House of Representatives
The Honorable Alec G. Olson
President of the Senate

I have the honor to inform you that the following enrolled Acts
of the 1974 Session of the State Legislature have been received
from the Office of the Governor and are deposited in the Office
of the Secretary of State for preservation pursuant to the State
Constitution, Article IV, Section 11 :



112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH 25, 1974 6749

S.F. H.F. Session Laws Date App,·oved Date Filed
No. No. Chapter No. 1974 1974

498 177 March 21 March 21

892 178 March 21 March 21

1795 179 March 21 March 21

1952 180 March 21 March 21

1966 181 March 21 March 21

1967 182 March 21 March 21

1986 183 March 21 March 21

2043 184 March 21 March 21

2144 185 March 21 March 21

2553 186 March 21 March 21

2595 187 March 21 March 21

2829 188 March 21 March 21

2833 189 March 21 March 21

2926 190 March 21 March 21

2936 191 March 21 March 21

3009 192 March 21 March 21

3041 193 March 21 March 21

3055 194 March 21 March 21

3086 195 March 21 March 21

3121 196 March 21 March 21

3142 197 March 21 March 21

3233 198 March 21 March 21

3264 199 March 21 March 21

3322 200 March 21 March 21



6750 JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE [112th Day

S.F'. ·H.F. Session Laws Date Approved Date Filed
No. No. Chapter No. 1974 1974

3331 201 March 21 March 21

3384 202 March 21 March 21

3394 203 March 21 March 21

1558 204 March 21 . March 21

1865 205 March 21 March 21

1877 206 March 21 March 21

Sincerely,

ARLEN I. ERDAHL
Secretary of State

STATE OF MINNESOTA
OFFICE OF THE SECRETARY OF STATE

ST. PAUL 55155

The Honorable Martin O. Sabo
Speaker of the House of Representatives
The Honorable Alec G. Olson
President of the Senate

I have the honor to inform you that the following enrolled Acts
of the 1974 Session of the State Legislature have been received
from the Office of the Governor and are deposited in the Office
of the Secretary of State for preservation pursuant to the State
Constitution, Article IV, Section 11:

S.F. H.F. Session Laws Date Approved Date Piled
No. No. Ghapter No. 1974 1974

1902 207 March 21 March 21

2450 208 March 21 March 21

2498 209 March 21 March 21

2568 210 March 21 March 21

2607 211 March 21 March 21

2781 212 March 21 March 21

2949 213 March 21 March 21



112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH 25, 1974 6751

SF. H.F. Session Laws Date App"oved Date Filed
No. No. Chapter No. 1974 ' 1974

2951 214 March 21 March 21

2953 215 March 21 March 21

2972 216 March 21 March 21

3169 217 March 21 March 21

3249 218 March 21 March 21

3426 219 March 21 March 21

3432 220 March 21 March 21

Sincerely,

ARLEN I. ERDAHL
Secretary of State

STATE OF MINNESOTA
OFFICE OF THE SECRETARY OF STATE

ST. PAUL 55155

The Honorable Martin O. Sabo
Speaker of the House of Representatives
The Honorable Alec G. Olson
President of the Senate

I have the honor to inform you that the following enrolled Acts
of the 1974 Session of the State Legislature have been received
from the Office of the Governor and are deposited in the Office
of the Secretary of State for preservation pursuant to the State
Constitution, Article IV, Section 11:

S.F.
No.

H.F.
No.

2148

Session Laws
Chapter No.

221

Date Approved
1974

March 22

Sincerely,

Date Filed
1974

March 22

. ARLEN 1. ERDAHL
Secretary of State

The following conference committee report was received:



6752 JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE [112th Day

CONFERENCE COMMITTEE REPORT ON H. F. NO.. 1951

March 22, 1974

Honorable Martin O. Sabo
Speaker of the House of Representatives
Honorable Alec G. Olson
President of the Senate

We, the undersigned conferees on the part of the House and
the Senate, upon the disagreeing votes as to H. F. No. 1951, re­
port that we have agreed upon the items in dispute and recom-
mend as follows: •

That the Senate recede from its amendments, and the bill be
amended as follows:

Strike everything after the enacting clause and insert in lieu
thereof the following:

"Section 1. [FINDINGS AND DECLARATION OF POL­
ICY.] It is. hereby found and determined that: The conditions
found to exist by the municipal housing and redevelopment act
as amended continue to exist throughout the state and in the area
in which the metropolitan council established by Minnesota Stat­
utes, Chapter 473B, has jurisdiction; substandard, slum and
blighted areas exist in the metropolitan area which cannot be
redeveloped without government assistance; there is a shortage
of decent, safe and sanitary dwelling accommodations available
to persons of low and moderate income at rentals or prices they
can afford; many municipalities in the metropolitan area are
unable adequately to provide the financing and staff necessary
to an effective municipal housing and redevelopment authority;
for each such municipality to establish a separate authority
would result in an inefficient use of manpower and services; and
there is therefore a need to enable the metropolitan council to
make available to the municipalities in the metropolitan area
those services provided for in the municipal housing and redevel­
opment act.

Sec. 2. [DEFINITIONS.] Subdivision 1. Unless the con­
text clearly indicates otherwise, the following terms, for the pur­
poses of this act, shall have the meanings ascribed to them in this
section.

Subd. 2. The terms defined in the municipal housing and
redevelopment act shall, for the purposes of this act, have the
meanings given them in that act.

Subd. 3. "Council" shall mean the metropolitan council cre­
ated by Minnesota Statutes, Section 473'8.02.



112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH 25, 1974 6753

Subd. 4.' "Metropolitan area" means the area in which the
council has jurisdiction under Minnesota Statutes, Section
473B.02.

Subd. 5. "Comprehensive development guide" means that
document prepared by the council pursuant to Minnesota Stat­
utes, Section 473B.06, Subdivision 5.

Sec. 3. [POWERS.] Subdivision 1. In addition to, and not
in limitation of, an other powers invested in it by law, the coun­
cil, and the members thereof, shall have, throughout the metro­
politan area, the same functions, rights, powers, duties, privi­
leges, immunities and limitations as are provided for housing
and redevelopment authorities created for municipalities, and
for the commissioners of such authorities. The provisions of
Minnesota Statutes, Sections 462.411 to 462.711 and of an other
laws relating to housing and redevelopment authorities shan be
applicable to the council when functioning as an authority, ex­
cept as herein provided or as clearly indicated otherwise from
the context of such laws. Minnesota Statutes, Section 462.425
shan have no application to the council nor to any municipality
or county Within which the council undertakes a project. Any

'municipality or county, and the governing bodies of any munici­
pality or county, within and for which the council undertakes
a project shall have all the powers, authority and obligations
granted to municipalities and counties by the provisions of Min­
nesota Statutes, Sections 462.411 to 462.711 and an other laws
relating to housing and redevelopment authorities. The council
may 'plan and propose projects within the boundaries of any
municipality, and may otherwise exercise the powers of an au­
thority at any time; provided, however, that the council shan not
implement any housing project, housing development project,
redevelopment project or urban renewal project within the
boundaries of any municipality or county without the prior ap­
provalof the governing body of the municipality or county in
which any such project is to be located; and provided further
that the council shall not propose any project to the governing
body of a municipality or county having an active authority
created pursuant to Minnesota Statutes, Section 462.425, or pur­
suant to special legislation, without first submitting the proposed
project to the municipal or county authority for its review and
recommendations; and provided further that as to any project
proposed by the council and approved by the municipality or
county, the council shall not undertake the project if within 60
days after it has been proposed, the municipality or county
agrees to undertake the project. All plans and projects of the
council shall be consistent with the comprehensive development
guide.. ,

Subd. 2. [TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE.] The council may
provide technical assistance to existing municipal or county
housing 'and redevelopment authorities at the request of such
authorities.



6754 JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE

------ ---- -

[112th Day

Subd. 3. [COOPERATION WITH OTHER GOVERNMENT
AGENCIES.] The council may cooperate with or act as agent
for the federal government, the state government, or any agen­
cies or instrumentalities thereof, in carrying out the provisions
of any federal or state legislation relating to the general pur­
poses of the municipal housing and redevelopment act.

Subd.4. [CITIZEN PARTICIPATION.] The council shall,
as part of any project proposal to a municipality, propose a
means for citizens substantially affected by the proposed project
to participate in the formulation and carrying out of projects
undertaken by the council pursuant to the terms of this act.

Subd. 5. [PROJECTS; REPORTS.] The council shall pre­
pare a detailed report on the progress of any project it under­
takes. The report shall be filed with the legislature not later than
January 15 of each year.

Sec. 4. [EFFECT UPON MUNICIPAL AND COUNTY
HOUSING AND REDEVELOPMENT AUTHORITIES.] Noth­
ing in this act shall be construed to impair the powers and obliga­
tions of municipal, county or multi-county housing and redevel­
opment authorities within the metropolitan area.

Sec. 5. [FINANCES.] Subdivision 1. The council shall
allocate the net unreimbursed costs of any project which it un­
dertakes to the municipality or group of municipalities or county
for which the project is undertaken. The governing body of each
such municipality or county shall impose taxes or other revenue
measures to provide funds necessary to pay the allocated costs,
and the governing body of each such municipality or county shall
have all the powers, authority and obligation granted to authori­
ties by Minnesota Statutes, Section 462.545 and all other provi­
sions of law regarding the financing of such projects, provided
that the council shall have the powers of an authority for pur­
poses of applying for and receiving federal grants in connection
with all projects which it undertakes.

Subd. 2. The council may expend for the purposes of this act
any revenues derived. pursuant to Minnesota Statutes, Section
.473B.08.".

Further, strike the title and insert in lieu thereof the follow­
ing:

"A bill for an act relating to the metropolitan council; grant­
ing the metropolitan council the powers of a municipal housing
and redevelopment authority in the metropolitan area",

, We request adoption of this report and repassage of the bill
in accordance therewith.



112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH 25, t974 6755

House Conferees: JAMES R. CASSERLY and WILLIAM H.
SCHREIBER.

Semite Conferees: HUBERT H. HUMPHREY, JOHN KEEFE, and
EUGENE STOKOWSKI.

Casserly moved that the report of the Conference Committee
on H. F. No. 1951 be adopted lind that the bill be repassed as
amended by the Conference Committee. The motion .prevailed.

. H. F. No. 1951, A bill for an act relating to the metropolitan
council; granting the metropolitan council the powers of a mu­
nicipal housing and redevelopment authority in the metropolitan
area, subject to municipal approval; providing for revenues.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by Confer­
ence, and placed upon its repassage.

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 76, and nays 49, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J. Cummiskey Kahn Nelson Schulz
Andersen, R. Dahl Kelly Norton Sherwood
Anderson, G. Dieterich Knickerbocker OJ ala Sieben, M.
Bell Eken Knoll Parish Stanton

.,
Bennett Enebo Kostohryz Patton Tomlinson
Berg Faricy LaVoy Pehler Ulland
Berglin Ferderer Lemke . Pleasant Vanasek
Braun Fudro Lindstrom, J. Prahl Vento
Brinkman Fugina Lombardi Quirin Voss
Carlson, A. Growe McArthur Resner Wenzel
Carlson, B. Hanson McCarron Rice Wolcott
Carlson, L. Hook McEachern Ryan Mr. Speaker
Casserly Jacobs McMillan St.Onge
Clifford Johnson, D. Miller,D. Salchert
Connors Johnson, J. Miller, M. Sarna
Culhane Jude Moe Schreiber

Those who voted in the negative were: < i

Adams, S. Eckstein Johnson, R. Mueller Searle '"i
Anderson; D. Erdahl Jopp Myrah Sieben, H.
Anderson, 1. Erickson Kempe Niehaus Skaar
Becklin Esau Klaus Ohnstad Smith
Belisle Fjoslien Laidig Pavlak, R. Spanish
Bieradorf Forsythe Larson Pavlak,R. L. Stangeland.
Carlson, D. Graw Long Peterson Weaver
Cleary Hagedorn Mann Pieper Wigley
DeGroat Heinitz McCauley Samuelson Wohlwend
Dirlam Johnson, C. McFarlin SavelkouI

The bill was repassed, as amended by Conference, and its title
.agreed to.



6756 JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE

CONSIDERATION UNDER RULE 72

[112th Day

Pursuant to Rule 72, Norton requested immediate considera­
tion of H. F. No. 3575.

H. F. No. 3575, A bill for an act providing additional bond
issuing authority to provide compensation to those members of
the armed forces who served during the Vietnam conflict; and
appropriating the proceeds thereof.

The bill was read for the third time and placed upon its final
passage.

The question being taken on the passage of the bill and the roll
being called, there were yeas 126, and nays 2, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams, J.
Adams,S.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, D.
Anderson, G.
Anderson, I.
Becklin
Belisle
Bell
Bennett
Berg
Berglin
Biersdorf
Braun
Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Carlson, B.
Carlson, D.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Cleary
Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Dahl
DeGroat

Dieterich
Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Enebo
Erdahl
Erickson
Eaau
Fariey
Ferderer
Fjoslien
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn
Hanson
Haugerud
Heinitz
Hook
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson, C.
Johnson, D.
Johnson, J.

Johnson, R. Miller, D.
Jopp Miller, M.
Jude Moe
Kahn Mueller
Kelly Myrah
Kempe Nelson
Klaus Niehaus
Knickerbocker Norton
Knoll Ohnstad
Kostohryz Ojala
Laidig Parish
Larson Patton
LaVoy Pavlak, R.
Lemke Pavlak,R.L.
Lindstrom, E. Pehler
Lindstrom, J. Peterson
Lombardi Pieper
Long Prahl
Mann Quirin
McArthur Resner
McCarron Rice
McCauley Ryan
McEachern St. Onge
McFarlin Salchert
McMillan Samuelson
Menke Sarna

Savelkoul
Schreiber
Searle
Sherwood
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Skaar
Smith
Spanish
Stangeland
Stanton
Swanson
Tomlinson
Vanasek
Vento
Voss
Weaver
Wenzel
Wigley
Wohlwend

. Wolcott
Mr. Speaker

Those who voted in the negative were:

Schulz Ulland

The bill was passed and its title agreed to.

The following conference committee reports were received:



112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH 25, 1974 6757

CONFERENCE COMMITTEE REPORT ON H. F. NO. 3035

March 22, 1974

Honorable Martin O. Sabo
Speaker of the House of Representatives
Honorable Alec G. Olson
President of the Senate

We, the undersigned conferees on the part of the House and
the Senate, upon the disagreeing votes as to H. F. No. 3035, rec­
ommend as follows:

That the Senate recede from its amendments and that the bill
be amended as follows:

Strike everything after the enacting clause and insert in iieu
thereof the following: '

"Section 1. The twin cities area metropolitan transit commis­
sion is hereby authorized to implement its bus service expansion
report as adopted by the metropolitan transit commission on
February 20, 1974. It is the intent of the legislature to have this
program substantially completed in 1977. No highway funds
dedicated for use in areas outside the twin cities metropolitan
public transit area shall be used for the purposes of this act. The
commission shall make a progress report to the legislature in
January of each year until the year following the completion of
this program. The 1975 report shall also include recommenda­
tions for alternative methods of financing and alternative bus
system passenger fares, including recommendations on single
fare plans and elimination of fare zones.

Sec. 2. Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section 473A.09, is amended
by adding a subdivision to read:

Subd. 12. [BUS SYSTEM FARES.] The commission shall'
not charge bus system passengers a total fare of more than $.50
for any ride; except that the commission may establish separate
fares for passengers on express bus service. This subdivision
shall be in effect on January 30, 1975.

Sec. 3. Minnesota Statutes, 1973 Supplement, Section
473A.ll1, Subdivision 1, is amended to read:

473A.ll1 [TRANSIT TAX LEVIES.] Subdivision l.
[AMOUNT.] For the purposes of chapter 473A and the metro­
politan transit system, the metropolitan transit commission may
levy upon all taxable property within the metropolitan transit
taxing district, defined herein, a transit tax, which shall not in
any year exceed the sum of the following:



6758 ·JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE [1l2th Day

(a) An amount equal to (1.45) 2.87 mills times the assessed
value of all such property some or all of the proceeds of which
may be used-to provide for the full and timely payment of its
certificates of indebtedness and other obligations of the commis­
sion to which collections of the wheelage tax and replacement
property tax under Minnesota Statutes 1969, Section 473A.14,
have been pledged, plus any amount needed for compliance with
any final judgment of a court of competent jurisdiction requiring
payment of any amount of the wheelage tax levied by the com­
mission for 1971 and prior years; except that the amount of
taxes which may be levied in any year for the operating costs
of the commission shall, except where this reduction would ren­
de" the commission ineligible for the federal aid involved, be
further "educed by the amount of any funds received by the com­
mission during the previous year from federal grants to coveT
operating costs; plus

(b) Such an additional amownt equal to .04 mills times the
assessed valuation of all such p"operty all of which shall be used
for the operating cost of service proirrnm» for the handicapped;
plus

«B» (c) Such additional amount, if any, as the commis­
sion determines to be necessary to provide for the full and timely
payment of its certificates of indebtedness and other obligations
to which property taxes under this section have been pledged,
provided that the amount of principal and interest to come due
on such obligations shall not exceed $3,000,000 in any year; plus
an additional amount not to exceed $2,000,000 in any one year
to be used exclusively to provide for the full and timely payment
of certificates of indebtedness and other obligations issued for
the purposes of the bus service expansion report as adopted by
the metropolitam. transit commission on February 20, 1974, to
which property taxes under this section have been pledged;

(d) Nothing in this section shall be construed as providing
funding for the preliminary engineering, studies, or construc­
tion for the automated fixed guidewa1/ euetem. proposed in the
1972 transit development program of the commission.

Sec. 4. Minnesota Statutes 1971,· Section 473A.l11, Subdivi­
sion 4, is amended to read:

Subd. 4. [USE OF PROCEEDS.] (1) A portion of the
proceeds of the tax described in this section shall be used to
provide transit services, at no cost, between the hours of 9 :00
AM and (3 :00) 3:30 PM, and from 6 :30 PM until the last bus
on Monday through Friday of each week, and all day Saturday
and Sunday to all those persons 65 years of age or over holding a r

medicare card or a special golden age identification card issued
by the commission, and to all those persons under the age of 18.

(2) Establish an express bus system to those areas within
the transit taxing district at the earliest practicable ·time over



112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH 25, 1974 6759

existing highways and streets in conjunction with the federal
highway administration, the urban mass transportation admin­
istration, the Minnesota highway department, the metropolitan
council, and other highway agencies.".

Further, amend the title in line 6 thereof, at the beginning of
the line strike "Section 473.09" and insert in lieu thereof "Sec­
tions 473A.09, by adding a subdivision; 473A.l11, Subdivi­
sion 4;".

We request adoption of this report and repassage of the bill
in accordance therewith.

House Conferees: JOHN TOMLINSON, GORDON VOSS, JOHN SAL­
CHERT, ROBERT BELL, and RAYMOND WOLCOTT.

Senate Conferees: JOHN CHENOWETH, EDWARD GEARTY, RALPH
DoTY, and WILLIAM KIRCHNER.

Tomlinson moved that the report of the Conference Committee
On H. F. No. 3035 be adopted and that the bill be repassed as
amended by the Conference Committee. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 3035, A bill for an act relating to mass transit; ap­
proving the bus service expansion report and providing funds
therefor; setting bus fares; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971,
Section 473.09 and Minnesota Statutes, 1973 Supplement, Sec­
tion 473A.ll1, Subdivision 1.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by Confer-'
ence, and placed upon its repaesage.

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 69, and nays 58, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, 1.
Bell
Bennett
Berg
Berg'lin
Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Clifford
Connors
Cummiskey

Dahl
Dieterich
Enebo
Faricy
Ferderer
Fudro
Fugina
Growe
Hanson
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson, D.
Johnson, R.
Kahn

Kelly Norton
Knickerbocker Ojala
Knoll Parish
Kostohryz Patton
LaVay Pavlak. R.
McArthur Pehler
McCarron Pleasant
McEachern Quirin
McFarlin Resner
Menke Rice
Miller,D. Ryan
Moe St.Onge
Munger Salchert
Nelson Sarna

Schreiber
Sherwood
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Swanson
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vanasek
Vento
Voss
Wenzel
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker



6760 JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE [112th Day

Those who voted in the negative were:

Adams, S.
Anderson, D.
Anderson, G.
Beddin
Belisle
Biersdorf
Braun
Carlson, B.
Carlson, D.
Culhane
DeGroat
Dirlam

Eckstein
Eken
Erdahl
Erickson
Esau
Fjoslien
Forsythe
Graw
Hagedorn
Heinitz
Hook
Johnson, C.

Johnson, J.
Jopp
Jude
Klaus
Laidig
Larson
Lemke
Lindstrom, E.
Lindstrom,J.
Lombardi
Long
Mann

McCauley
McMillan
Miller, M.
Mueller
Myrah
Newcome
Niehaus
Ohnstad
Pavlak, R. L.
Peterson
Pieper
Prahl

Samuelson
Savelkoul
Schulz
Searle
Skaar .
Smith
Stangeland
Weaver
Wigley
Wohlwend

The bill was repassed, as amended by Conference, and its title
agreed to.

CONFERENCE COMMITTEE REPORT ON H. F. NO. 3712

March 22, 1974

Honorable Martin O. Sabo
Speaker of the House of Representatives
Honorable Alec G. Olson
President of the Senate

We, the undersigned conferees on the part of the House and
the Senate, upon the disagreeing votes as to H. F. No. 3712,
report that we have agreed upon the items in dispute and recom­
mend as follows:

That the Senate recede from its amendments and that H. F. No.
3712 be further amended as follows:

Page 2, lines 13 to 17, delete all of the language and renumber
the remaining subdivisions in sequence.

Page 11, line 5, strike "may" and insert "shall. attempt to".,

Page 11, lines 11 to 13, reinstate stricken language and delete
the underscored·language.

We request adoption of this report and repassage of the bill
in accordance therewith.

House Conferees: RAY W. FARICY, DALE ERDAHL, and'PAUL
MCCARRON.

Senate Conferees: CLARENCE PURFEERST, JEROME V. BLATZ,
and STANLEY N. THORUP.

Farley moved that the report of the Conference Committee
on H. F. No. 3712 be adopted and that the bill be repassed as
amended by the Conference Committee. The motion prevailed.



112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH 25, 1974 6761

H. F. No. 3712, A bill for an act relating to claims against the
state; appropriating moneys for the payment thereof; amending
Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section 3.732, Subdivisions 2, 4 and 5.

The bill was read for the third· time, as amended by Confer­
ence, and placed upon its repassage,

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 127, and nays 2, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J.
Adams, S.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, D.
Anderson, G.
Anderson, I.
Becklin
Belisle
Bell
Bennett
Berg
Berglin
Biersdorf
Braun
Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Carlson, B.
Carlson, D.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Cleary
Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl

DeGroat
Dieterich
Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Enebo
Erdahl
Erickson
Esau
Faricy
Ferderer
Fjoslien
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn
Hanson
Haugerud
Reinitz
Hook
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson, C.
Johnson, D.

Johnson,J. Miller, D.
Johnson, R. Miller, M.
Jopp Moe
Jude Mueller
Kahn Munger
Kelly Myrah
Kempe Nelson
Klaus Newcome
Knickerbocker Niehaus
Knoll Norton
Kostohryz Ohnstad
Laidig Ojala
Larson Parish
LaVoy Patton
Lemke Pavlak, R.
Lindstrom, E. Pavlak, R. L.
Lindstrom, J. Pehler
Lombardi Peterson
Mann Pieper
McArthur Pleasant
McCarron Prahl
McCauley Quirin
McEachern Resner
McFarlin Rice
McMillan Ryan
Menke St. Onge

Salehert
Samuelson
Sarna
Savelkoul
Schulz
Searle
Sherwood
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Smith
Stangeland
Stanton
Swanson
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vanasek
Vento
Voss
Weaver
Wenzel
Wigley
Wohlwend
Mr. Speaker

Those who voted in the negative were:

Long Skaar

The bill was repassed, as amended by Conference, and its title
agreed to.

CONFERENCE COMMITTEE REPORT ON H. F. NO. 2992

March 22, 1974
Honorable Martin O. Saba
Speaker of the House of Representatives
Honorable Alec G. Olson
President of the Senate

We, the undersigned conferees on the part of the House and
the Senate, upon the disagreeing votes as to H. F. No. 2992, re­
port that we have agreed upon the items in dispute and recom­
mend as follows:



6762 JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE [112th Day

That the House accede to the Senate amendment and that the
amendment adopted by the Senate on March 19, 1974 to H. F.
No. 2992 be further amended as follows:

Page 2, line 1, after the period insert "The articles of this act
are numbered out of sequence to facilitate the possible inclusion
of other articles of the probate code in one chapter.".

Page 6, line 3, after "estate" insert "or to actions pursuant
to Minnesota Statutes, Section 573.02".

Page 6, line 7, after "court" insert "or county court".
,

Page 6, line 19, strike "524.5-401" and insert in lieu thereof
"525.54".

Page 7, line 19, strike "defined" and insert in lieu thereof
"described".

Page 7, line 20, strike "524.5-101" and insert in lieu thereof
"525.54, other than a minor".

Page 9, line 21, strike "defined" and insert in lieu thereof
"described".

Page 9, line 22, strike "524.5-101" and insert in lieu thereof
"525.54, Subdivision 2".

Page 9, line 23, strike "defined in section" and insert in lieu
thereof "described in sections".

Page 9, line 24, strike "524.5-101" and insert in lieu thereof
"525.541 to 525.551".

Page 11, line 11, strike "article VI" and insert in lieu thereof
"chapter 528".

Page 11, line 24, strike "defined" and insert in lieu thereof
"described".

Page 11, line 24, strike "524.5-101" and insert in lieu thereof
"525.54, Subdivision 1".

Page 21, line 8, after "article" insert "except that the time
limited for filing claims under section 525.41 shall be 60 days
from the date of the filing of the application for appointment
of a personal representative. The notice to creditors shall be in
the form prescribed by court rule.".

Page 22, line 5, after the period insert "This section shall
not be applicable to actions under Minnesota Statutes, Section
573.02.".



112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH 25, 1974 6763

Page 66, line 5, strike "or he may" and insert in lieu thereof
"and shall".

. Page 66, line 6, after "court" insert "and an executed copy of
the Minnesota inheritance tax return with the court and the same
shall be part of the court records".

Page 68, line 7, after "court" insert "and when so exercised
shall transfer good title to the transferee to the same extent that
decedent had title thereto".

Page 83, line 20, strike "Accodingly" and insert in lieu there­
of "Accordingly".

Page 89, line 12, after "other" strike "death".

Page 89, line 14, after "been" and before "distributed" insert
"inventoried and".

Page 89, line 15, after "claims" and before "remain" insert
", expenses or taxes".

Page 89, line 15, strike "state".

Page 89, strike lines 16 and 17.

Page 89, line 18, strike "the distributees or it shall".

Page 104, line 20, strike "525.80, and 525.83" and insert in
lieu t.hereof "and 525.80".

Page 105, strike lines 1 to 7 and insert in lieu thereof:

"Sec. 524.8-103. [EARLY EFFECTIVE DATE.] Notwith­
standing section 524.8-101, the provisions of this act relating to
bonds found at sections 524.3-603 to 524.3-606 and article IX of
this act, and that portion of section 524.8·102 which repeals Min.
nesota Statutes 1971, Sections 525.32 to 525.324, are effective
August 1, 1974. .

ARTICLE IX".

Page 105, line 14, strike "Sec. 146" and insert in lieu thereof
"Section 1".

Page 106, line 8, strike "147" and insert in lieu thereof "2".

Page 106, line 19, after "fees" insert "and representative
fees".

Page 106, line 24, strike "148" and insert in lieu thereof "3".



6764 JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE [U2th Day

Page 107, line 25, strike "147" and insert ·in lieu thereof "2".

Page 108, line 3, after "fees" insert "and representative
fees".

Further, amend the title as follows:

Page 108, line 29, strike "525.80, and 525.83" and insert in lieu
thereof "and 525.80".

We request adoption of this report and repassageof the bill
in accordance therewith.

House Conferees: JOHN C. LINDSTROM, NEIL S. HAUGERUD,
WILLIS R. EKEN, and ARLAN STANGELAND.

Senate Conferees: CLARENCE M. PURFEERST, ROBERT J. BROWN,
JACK DAVIES, and ROBERT DUNN.

Lindstrom, J., moved that the report of the Conference Com­
mittee on H. F. No. 2992 be adopted and that the bill be repassed
as amended by the Conference Committee.

A roll call was requested and properly seconded.

The question was taken on the motion and the roll being called,
there were yeas 99, and nays 23, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, G.
Anderson, I.
Becklin
Belisle
Bennett
Berg
Biersdorf
Braun
Carlson, B.
Carlson, D.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Cleary
Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl

DeGroat
Dieterich
Eckstein
Eken
Enebo
Faricy
Ferderer
Fjoslien
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn­
Hanson
Haugerud
Heinitz
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson, C.
Johnson, D.

Johnson, J. McMillan
Jopp Menke
Jude Miller. D.
Kahn Miller. M.
Kelly .Munger
Kempe Myrah
Knickerbocker Nelson
Knoll Niehaus
Kostohryz Ohnstad
Laidig Ojala
Larson Patton
LaVoy Pehler .
Lemke Peterson
Lindstrom, E. Pieper
Lindstrom, J. Pleasant
Mann Prahl
McArthur Quirin
McCarron Resner
McCauley Ryan
McEachern St. Onge

Sarna
Savelkoul
Sherwood
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Smith
Spanish
Stangeland
Stanton
Swanson
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vanasek
Vento
Voss
Wenzel
Wigley
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker

Those who voted in the negative were:

Adams, S.
Anderson, D.
Brinkman

Carlson, A.
Dirlam
Erdahl

Erickson
Johnson, R.
Klaus

Long
McFarlin
Mueller

Newcome
Norton
Parish



112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH 25, 1974 6765

Pavlak, R. Rice
Pavlak, R. L. Schreiber

The motion prevailed.

Searle
Skaar

Weaver Wohlwend

H. F. No. 2992, A bill for an act relating to probate proceed­
ings; regulating the inventory and appraisal of guardianships
and decedents' estates; amending Minnesota Statutes, 1973 Sup­
plement, Section 525.33; Minnesota Statutes 1971, Chapter 525,
by adding a section; repealing Minnesota Statutes, 1973 Supple­
ment, Section 525.331.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by Confer­
ence, and placed upon its repassage.

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 103, and nays 21, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, G.
Anderson, 1.
Becklin
Belisle
Bennett
Berg
Biersdorf
Braun
Brinkman
Carlson. B.
Carlson,D.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Cleary
Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl

DeGroat
Dieterich
Eckstein
Eken
Enebo
Erdahl
Faricy
Ferderer
Fjoslien
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn
Hanson
Haugerud
Heinitz
Hook
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson, C.

Johneon, D. McCauley
J ohnscn, J. McEachern
J opp McMillan
Jude Menke
Kahn Miller, D.
Kelly Miller, M.
Kempe Munger
Knickerbocker Myrah
Knoll Nelson
Kostohryz Niehaus
Kvam Ohnstad
Laidig Ojala
Larson Patton
LaVoy Pehler
Lemke Peterson
Lindstrom, E. Pieper
Lindstrom, J. Pleasant
Lombardi Prahl
Mann Quirin
McArthur Resner
McCarron Ryan

St.Onge
Sarna
Savelkoul
Sherwood
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Smith
Spanish
Stangeland
Stanton
Swanson
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vanasek
Vento
Voss
Wenzel
Wigley
Wolcott

Those who voted in the negative were:

Adams.B.
Anderson, D.
Carlson, A.
Dirlam
Erickson

Esau
Johnson, R.
Klaus
Long
McFarlin

Mueller
Newcome
Norton
Parish
Pavlak,R.

Pavlak, R. L.
Rice
Schreiber
Skaar
Weaver

Wohlwend

The bill was repassed, as amended by Conference, and its title
agreed to.

Anderson, 1., moved that the House recess subject to the call
of the Chair. The motion prevailed.

RECESS



6766 JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE

RECONVENED

[112th Day

The House reconvened and was called to order by the .Speaker.

MESSAGES FROM THE SENATE

The following messages were received from the Senate:

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned as amended by the Senate, in which
amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully re­
quested:

H. F. No. 862, A bill for an act relating to highway traffic
regulations; motor vehicle equipment; loads ; weighing of certain
vehicles; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Sections 169.67,
Subdivision 4; 169.73, Subdivision 2; 169.80, Subdivision 3;
169.85; and Chapter 169, by adding a section.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce that the Senate wishes to recall for the pur­
pose of further consideration House File No. 862 :

H. F. No. 862, A bill for an act relating to highway traffic
regulations; motor vehicle equipment; loads; weighing of certain
vehicles; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Sections 169.67,
Subdivision 4; 169.73, Subdivision 2; 169.80, Subdivision 3;
169.85; and Chapter 169, by adding a section.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

Pehler moved that the House accede to the request of the Sen­
ate for the return of H. F. No. 862 for further consideration by
the Senate. The motion prevailed.

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce that the Senate has concurred in and
adopted the report of the Conference Committee on :

H. F. No. 3712, A bill for an act relating to claims against the
state; appropriating moneys for the payment thereof; amending
Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section 3.732, Subdivisions 2, 4 and 5.



112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH 25, 1974 6767

The Senate has repassed said bill, in accordance with the rec­
ommendation and report of the Conference Committee. Said
House File is herewith returned to the House.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce that the Senate has concurred in and
adopted the report of the Conference Committee on:

H. F. No. 1951, A bill for an act relating to the metropolitan
council; granting the metropolitan council the powers of a mu­
nicipal housing and redevelopment authority in the metropolitan
area, subject to municipal approval; providing for revenues.

The Senate has repassed said bill, in accordance with the rec­
ommendation and report of the Conference Committee. Said
House File is herewith returned to the House.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce that the Senate has concurred in and
adopted the report of the Conference Committee on:

H. F. No. 3035, A bill for an act relating to mass transit; ap­
proving the bus service expansion report and providing funds
therefor; setting bus fares; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971,
Section 473.09 and Minnesota Statutes, 1973 Supplement, Section
473A.11l, Subdivision 1.

The Senate has repassed said bill, in accordance with the rec­
ommendation and report of the Conference Committee. Said
House File is herewith returned to the House.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:

H. F. No. 242, A bill for an act relating to highway traffic
regulations; television in motor vehicles; prohibiting the use of
certain listening devices while operating a motor vehicle; amend­
ing Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section 169.471.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate



6768 JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

[112th Day

Pehler moved that the House concur in the Senate amendments
to H. F. No. 242 and that the bill be repassed as amended by the
Senate. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 242, A bill for an act relating to highway traffic
regulations; television in motor vehicles; prohibiting the use of
certain listening devices while operating a motor· vehicle;
amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section 169.471.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage.

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 123, and nays 0, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J.
Adams,S.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, D.
Anderson, G.
Anderson, 1.
Becklin
Belisle
Bell
Bennett
Berg
Berglin
Biersdorf
Braun
Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Cerlscn.B.
Carlson, D.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Cleary
Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey

Dahl
DeGroat
Dieterich
Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Enebo
Erdahl
Erickson
Esau
Faricy
Ferderer
Fjoslien
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn
Hanson
Haugerud
Heinitz
Hook
Jacobs
Jaros

Johnson, C. McMillan
Johnson, D. Menke
Johnson, J. Miller, D.
Jopp Miller, M.
Jude Moe
Kahn Munger
Kelly Myrah
Kempe Nelson
Knickerbocker Newcome
Knoll Niehaus
Kostohryz Norton
Kvam Ohnstad
Laidig OJala
Larson Parish
LaVoy Patton
Lemke Pavlak, R.
Lindstrom, E. Pavlak, R. L.
Lindstrom, J. Pehler
Lombardi Peterson
Long Pieper
McArthur Pleasant
McCarron Prahl
McCauley Quirin
McEachern Resner
McFarlin Rice

Ryan
St.Onge
Sarna
Savelkoul
Schreiber
Schulz
Searle
Sherwood
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Skaar
Smith
Stangeland
Stanton
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vanasek
Vento
Wenzel
Wigley
Wohlwend
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the folIowing
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfulIy
requested:



112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH 25, 1974 6769

H. F. No. 3313, A bill for an act regarding concession facilities
at the Minnesota zoological garden; amending Minnesota Stat­
utes 1971, Section 85A.03, Subdivision 4.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

Sieben, M., moved that the House concur in the Senate amend­
ments to H. F. No. 3313 and that the bill be repassed as amended
by the Senate. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 3313, A bill for an act regarding concession facilities
at the Minnesota zoological garden; amending Minnesota Stat­
utes 1971, Section 85A.03, Subdivision 4.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage.

The question being taken on the .repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 107, and nays 18, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams, J.
Adams,S.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, D.
Anderson, G.
Anderson, I.
Becklin
Belisle
Bennett
Berg
Berglin
Biersdorf
Braun
Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Carlson, B.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Cleary
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey

Dahl
Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Enebo
Erickson
Eaau
Faricy
Ferderer
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn
Hanson
Haugerud
Hook
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson,C.
Johnson, D.

Johnson, J. McMillan
Jude Menke
Kahn Miller, D.
Kelly Miller, M.
Kempe Moe
Klaus Munger
Knickerbocker Nelson
Knoll Newcome
Kcstohrye Norton
Laidig Parish
Larson Pavlak, R.
LaVoy Pavlak, R. L.
Lemke Pehler
Lindstrom, J. Peterson
Lombardi Pieper
Long Quirin
Mann Resner
McArthur Rice

. McCarron Ryan
McCauley St. Onge
McEachern Samuelson
McFarlin Sarna

Schreiber
Schulz
Searle
Sherwood
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Skaar
Smith
Stangeland
Stanton
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vanasek
Vento
Wenzel
Wigley
Wohlwend
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker

Those who voted in the negative were:

Bell
Carlson, D.
Clifford
DeGroat

Erdahl
Fjoslien
Reinitz
Jopp

Kvam
Lindstrom, E.
Myrah
Niehaus

Ohnstad
Ojala
Patton
Pleasant

Prahl
Savelkoul

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.



6770

Mr. Speaker:

JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE [112th Day

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:

H. F. No. 2236, A bill for an act relating to courts: salaries
of county court judges; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Sec­
tion 487.05.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

Pavlak, R., moved that the House refuse to concur in the
Senate amendments to H.F. No. 2236, that the Speaker appoint
a Conference Committee of 5 members of the House, and that
the House requests that a like committee be appointed by the
Senate to confer on the disagreeing votes of the two Houses. The
motion prevailed.

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:

H. F. No. 3240, A bill for an act relating to the legislature;
Indian affairs commission; raising the per diem pay of mem­
bers; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section 3.922, Subdivi­
sion 3.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

Casserly moved that the House concur in the Senate amend­
ments to H. F. No. 3240 and that the bill be repassed as amended
by the Senate. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 3240, A bill for an act relating to the legislature;
Indian affairs commission; raising the per diem pay of mem­
bel's; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section 3.922, Subdivi­
sion 3.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage,

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
toll being called, there were yeas 117, and nays 11, as follows:



112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH 25, 1974 6771

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J.
Adams, S.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, D.
Anderson, G.
Anderson, I.
Becklin
Belisle
Bell
Bennett
Berg
Berglin
Biersdorf
Braun
Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Carlson, B.
Carlson, D.
Carlson, L.
Casserly.
Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey

Dahl
Dieterich
Eckstein
Eken
Enebo
Erdahl
Faricy
Ferderer
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn
Hanson
Haugerud
Reinitz
Hook
Jacobs
Jaros _
Johnson, C.
Johnson, D.
Johnson, J.
Johnson, R.

Jopp Mueller
Jude Munger
Kahn Myrah
Kelly Nelson
Kempe Newcome
Klaus Niehaus
Knickerbocker Norton
Knoll Parish
Kostohryz Patton
Laidig Pavlak, R.
Larson Pavlak, R. L.
LaVoy Pehler
Lemke Peterson
Lindstrom, E. Pieper
Lindstrom, J. Pleasant
Lombardi Prahl
Mann Quirin
McArthur Resner
McCauley· Rice
McFarlin Ryan
McMillan St. Onge
Menke Samuelson
Miller, D. Sarna
Moe Savelkoul

Schreiber
Schulz
Searle
Sherwood
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Skaar
Smith
Spanish
Stangeland
Stanton
Swanson
Tomlinson
Ulland
vanasek
Vento
Wenzel
Wigley
Wohlwend
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker

Those who voted in the negative were:

Cleary
DeGroat
Dirlam

Erickson
Esau
Fjoslien

Kvam
Long
McEachern

Miller, M. Ohnstad

The hill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to..

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:

H. F. No. 2065, A bill for an act relating to the promotion of
tourism of the state; providing for the financing of tourist and
related recreational facilities; amending Minnesota Statutes
1971, Section 474.02, by adding a suhdivision.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

Smith moved that the House concur in the Senate amend­
ments to H. F. No. 2065 and that the bill he repassed as amended
by the Senate. The motion prevailed.



6772 JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE [112th Day

H. F. No. 2065, A bill for an act relating to the promotion of
tourism in the state; providing for the financing of tourist and
related recreational facilities; amending Minnesota Statutes
1971, Section 474.02, by adding a subdivision.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage.

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 123, and nays 5, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J.
Adams, S.
Andersen, R!
Anderson, D.
Anderson, G.
Anderson, I.
Becklin
Belisle
Bell
Bennett
Berglin
Biersdorf
Braun
Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Carlson, B.
Carlson, D.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Cleary
Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Commiskey
Dahl

DeGroat
Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Eneba
Erdahl
Erickson
Eaau
Ferderer
Fjoslien
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn
Hanson
Haugerud
Reinitz
Hook
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson, C.
Johnson, D.
Johnson,J.

Johnson, R. Menke
Jopp Miller, D.
Jude Miller, M.
Kelly Moe
Kempe Munger
Klaus Myrah
Knickerbocker Nelson
Knoll Newcome
Kostohryz Niehaus
Kvam Norton
Laidig Ohnstad
Larson Ojala
LaVoy Parish
Lemke Patton
Lindstrom, E. Pavlak, R.
Lindstrom, J. Pavlak, R. L.
Lombardi Pehler
Long Peterson
Mann Pieper
McArthur Prahl
McCarron Quirin
lI4cCauley Resner
McEachern Rice
McFarlin Ryan
McMillan St. Onge

Samuelson
Sarna
Savelkoul
Schreiber
Schulz
Searle
Sherwood
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Skaar
Smith
Spanish
Stangeland
Stanton
Swanson
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vanasek
Wenzel
Wigley
Wohlwend
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker

Those who voted in the negative were:

Berg Dieterich Faricy Pleasant Vento

c-.

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:

H. F. No. 1716, A bill for an act relating to wild animals; lim­
iting the use of certain firearms in relation to firearm deer sea­
sons; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section 100.29, Sub­
divisions 3 and 9.

PATRICK E. FLAHAYEN, Secretary of the Senate



112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH 25, 1974

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

6773

Lemke moved that the House concur in the Senate amend­
ments to H. F. No. 1716 and that the bill be repassed as amended
by the Senate. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 1716, A bill for an act relating to wild animals; lim­
iting the use of certain firearms in relation to firearm deer
seasons; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section 100.29, Sub­
divisions 3 and 9.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage.

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 122, and 'lays 5, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J.
Adams, S. .
Andersen, R.
Anderson, D.
Anderson, G.
Anderson. I.
Becklin
Belisle
Bell
Bennett.
Berg
Berglin
Biersdorf
Braun
Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Carlson, B.
Carlson, D.
Carlson, L.
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl
DeGroat
Dieterich

Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Enebo
Erdahl
Erickson
Eaau
Faricy
Ferderer
Fjoslien
Forsythe
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn
Haugerud
Heinitz
Hook
Jacobs
Jaros

- Johnson, C.
Johnson, D.
Johnson,J.
Johnson,R.
Jopp

Jude Miller, M.
Kahn Moe
Kelly Mueller
Klaus Munger
Knickerbocker Myrah
Knoll Nelson
Kostohryz Newcome
Kvarn Niehaus
Laidig Norton
Larson Ohnstad
LaVoy Ojala
Lemke Patton
Lindstrom, E. Pavlak, R.
Lindstrom, J. Pavlak, R. L.
Lombardi Pehler
Long Peterson
Mann Pieper
McArthur . Prahl
McCarron Quirin
McCauley Resner
McEachern Rice
McFarlin Ryan
McMillan St. Onge
Menke Samuelson
Miller, D. Sarna

Savelkoul
Schreiber

.Schulz
Searle
Sherwood
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Skaar
Smith
Spanish
Stangeland
Stanton
Swanson
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vanasek
Vento
Wenzel
Wigley
Wohlwend
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker

Those who voted in the negative were:

Cleary Clifford Hanson Kempe Pleasant

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to. .

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:



6774 JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE· [112th Day

H. F. No. 2928, A bill for an act reappropriating moneys for
capital and related improvements for university and college pur­
poses.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

Munger moved that the House refuse to concur in the Senate
amendments to H. F. No. 2928, that the Speaker appoint a Con­
ference Committee of 3 members of the House, and that the
House requests that a like committee be appointed by the Senate
to confer on the disagreeing votes of the two Houses. The motion
prevailed.

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:

H. F . No. 2605, A bill for an act relating to the village of
Grand Rapids; authorizing. the. issuance of on-sale licenses for
the sale of intoxicating liquor.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

Prahl moved that the House concur in the Senate amendments
to H. F. No. 2605 and that the bill be repassed as amended by the
Senate. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 2605, A bill for an act relating to the village of
Grand Rapids; authorizing the issuance of on-sale licenses for
the sale of intoxicating liquor.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate, .
and placed upon its repassage.

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 110, and nays 16, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams, J.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, G.
Anderson, I.
Belisle
Bell
Bennett
Berg
Berghn

Biersdorf
Brann
Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Carlson, B.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Cleary
Clifford

Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl
DeGroat
Dieterich
Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken

, Enebo
Faricy
Ferderer
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn

Hanson
Haugerud
Heinitz
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson, C.
Johnson, D.
Johnson, R.
Jude



112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH 25, 1974 6775

Kahn McArthur
Kelly McCarron
Kempe McCauley
Knickerbocker McEachern
Knoll McFarlin
Kostohryz McMillan
Laidig Menke
LaVoy Miller, D.
Lemke Miller, M.
Lindstrom, E. Moe
Lindstrom, J. Mueller
Lombardi Munger
Mann Myrah

Nelson
Newcome
Niehaus
Ojala
Parish
Patton
Pavlak, R.
Pavlak, R. L.
Pehler
Peterson
Pieper
Pleasant
Prahl

Quirin
Resner
Ryan
St.Onge
Samuelson
Sarna
Savelkoul
Schreiber
Schulz
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Skaar
Smith

Spanish
Stangeland
Stanton
Swanson
Tomlinson
Uiland
Vanasek
Vento
Wenzel
Wigley
Wohlwend
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker

Those who voted in the negative were:

Anderson, D.
Becklin
Carlson, D.
Erdahl

Erickson
Esau
Fjoslien
Hook

Johnson,J.
Jopp
Kvam
Long

Ohnstad
Rice

Searle
Sherwood

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:

H. F. No. 1192, A bill for an act relating to utilities; private
and publicly owned companies; providing for regulations as to
customer deposits.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN. Secretary of the Senate

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

Jaros moved that the House concur in the Senate amendmerits
to H. F. No. 1192 and that the bill be repassed as amended by the
Senate. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 1192, A bill for an act relating to utilities; private
and publicly owned companies; providing for regulations as to
customer deposits.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage.

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 129, and nays 0, as follows:



6776 JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE [112th Day

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J.
Adams, S.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, D.
Anderson, G.
Anderson, I.
Becklin
Belisle
Bell
Bennett
Berg
Berglin
Biersdorf
Braun
Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Carlson, B.
Carlson, D.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Cleary
Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl

DeGroat
Dieterich
Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Enebc
Erdahl
Erickson
EsaiJ
Faricy
Ferderer
Fjoslien
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn
Hanson
Haugerud
Reinitz
Hook
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson, C.
Johnson, D.

Johnson, J. McMillan
Jehnaon, R. Menke
Jopp Miller, D.
Jude Miller, M.
Kahn Moe
Kelly Mueller
Kempe Munger
Klaus Myrah
Knickerbocker Nelson
Knoll Newcome
Kostohryz Niehaus
Kvam Ohnstad
Laidig Ojala
Larson Parish
LaVay Patton
Lemke Pavlak, R.
Lindstrom, E. Pavlak, R. L.
Lindstrom, J. Pehler
Lombardi Peterson
Long Pieper
Mann Prahl
McArthur Quirin
McCarron Resner
McCauley Rice
McEachern Ryan
McFarlin St. Dnge

Samuelson
Sarna
Savelkoul
Schreiber
Schulz
Searle
Sherwood
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Skaar
Smith
Spanish
Stangeland
Stanton
Swanson
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vanasek
Vento
Voss
Wenzel
Wigley
Wohlwend
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:

H. F. No. 3223, A bill for an act relating to the governor's
citizens council on aging; duties of council; disbursement of
funds; amending Minnesota Statntes 1971, Sections 256.975,
Subdivision 2; and 256.01, Snbdivision 10.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

Eken moved that the House concur in the Senate amendments
to H. F. No. 3223 and that the bill be repassed as amended by
the Senate. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 3223, A bill for an act relating to the governor's
citizens council on aging; duties of council; authority over funds;
amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Sections 256.975, Sub­
division 2; and 256.01, Subdivision 10.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage.



112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH 25, 1974 6777

The question being taken on the rspassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 129, and nays .0, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams, J.
Adams, S.
Andersen, R.
Anderson. D.
Anderson. G.
Anderson, I.
Becklin
Belisle
Bell
Bennett
Berg
Berglin
Biersdorf
Braun
Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Carlson, B.
Carlson, D.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Cleary
Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl

DeGroat
Dieterich
Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Enebo
Erdahl
Erickson
Esau
Faricy
Ferderer
Fjoslien
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn
Hanson
Haugerud
Reinitz
Hook
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson, C.
Johnson, D.

Jchnaon, J. McMillan
Johnson, R. Menke
Jopp Miller, D,
Jude Miller, M.
Kahn Moe
Kelly Mueller
Kempe Munger
Klaus "Myrah
Knickerbocker Nelson
Knoll Newcome
Kostohryz Niehaus
Kvam Ohnstad
Laidig Ojala
Larson Parish
LaVoy Patton
Lemke Pavlak, R.
Lindstrom, E. Pavlak, R. L.
Lindstrom, J. Pehler
Lombardi Peterson
Long Pieper
Mann Pleasant
McArthur Prahl
McCarron Quirin
McCauley Resner
McEachern Rice
McFarlin Ryan

St.Onge
Samuelson
Sarna
Savelkoul
Schreiber
Schulz
Searle
Sherwood
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Skaar
Smith
Spanish
Stangeland
Stanton
Swanson
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vanasek
Vento
Wenzel
Wigley·
Wohlwend
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:

H. F. No. 1382, A bill for an act relating to insurance; de­
posits by domestic insurance companies; defining the kind of .
securities which domestic insurance companies must keep on
deposit for the protection of policyholders; requiring all securi­
ties to be deposited in a state or national bank in Minnesota;
amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Sections 60A.10, Subdivi­
sions 1 and 4, and by adding a subdivision : 60A.19, Subdivision
5: 61A.41; 63.02; 65A.22; 66A.08, Subdivision 1; and 68A.01,
Subdivision 3.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

Brinkman moved that the House concur in the Senate amend­
ments to H. F. No. 1382 and that the bill be repassed as amend­
ed by the Senate. The motion prevailed.



6778 JOURNAl, OF THE HOUSE [1l2th Day

H. F. No. 1382, A bill for an act relating to insurance; deposits
by domestic insurance companies; defining the kind of securities
which domestic insurance companies must keep on deposit for
the protection of policyholders; requiring all securities to be de­
posited in a state or national bank in Minnesota; amending Min­
nesota Statutes 1971, Sections 60A.10, Subdivisions 1 and 4, and
by adding a subdivision; 60A.19, Subdivision 5; 61A.41; 63.02;
65A.22; 66A.08, Subdivision 1; and 68A.01, Subdivision 3.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage.

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 128, and nays 0, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J.
Adams, S.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, D.
Anderson, G.
Anderson, I.
Becklin
Belisle
Bell
Bennett
Berg
Berglin
Biersdorf
Braun
Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Carlson, B.
Carlson, D.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Cleary
Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl

DeGroat
Dieterich
Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Enebo
Erdahl
Erickson
Esau
Faricy
Ferderer
Fjoslien
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn
Hanson
Haugerud
Reinitz
Hook
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson, C.
Johnson, D.

Johnson, J.
Johnson, R.
Jopp
Jude
Kahn
Kelly
Kempe
Klaus
Knickerbocker
Knoll
Kostohryz
Kvam
Laidig
Larson
LaVoy
Lemke
Lindstrom, E.
Lindstrom, J.
Lombardi
Long
Mann
McArthur
McCarron
McCauley
McEachern
McFarlin

McMillan
Menke
Miller, D.
Miller, M.
Moe
Mueller
Munger
Myrah
Nelson
Newcome
Niehaus
Ohnstad
Ojala
Parish
Patton
Pavlak, R.
Pavlak, R. L.
Pehler
Peterson
Pieper
Pleasant
Prahl
Quirin
Resner
Rice
Ryan

Stc Onge
Samuelson
Sarna
Savelkoul
Schreiber
Searle
Sherwood
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Skaar
Smith
Spanish
Stangeland
Stanton
Swanson
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vanasek
Vento
Wenzel
Wigley
Wohlwend
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker

The biIl was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:

H. F. No. 3352, A bill for an act relating to agriculture; grain
weighing, sampling and analysis; providing penalties; amending
Minnesota Statutes 1971, Sections 232.08; and 235.01; repealing
Minnesota Statutes 1971, Sections 232.05; 233.135; 233.137;



112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH 25, 1974 6779

233.17 to 233.21; 233.25 to 233.32; 233.34 to 233.40;235.03;
235.11; 235.12; 235.14 to 235.17; and 235.19.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

Eken moved that the House concur in the Senate amendments
to H. F. No. 3352 and that the bill be repassed as amended by
the Senate. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 3352, A bill for an act relating to agriculture; grain
weighing, sampling and analysis; providing penalties; amending
Minnesota Statutes 1971, Sections 232.08; and 235.01; repealing
Minnesota Statutes 1971, Sections 232.05; 233.135; 233.137;
233.17 to 233.21; 233.25 to 233.32; 233.34 to 233.40; 235.03;
235.11; 235.12; 235.14 to 235.17; and 235.19.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage,

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 130, and nays 0, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J.
Adams, S.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, D.
Anderson, G.
Anderson, I.
Becklin
Belisle
Ben
Bennett
Berg
Bergltn
Biersdorf
Braun
Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Carlson, B.
Carlson, D.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Cleary
Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl

DeGroat
Dieterich
Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Enebo
Erdahl
Erickson
Esau
Farlcy
Ferderer
Fjoslien
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn
Hanson
Haugerud
Reinitz
Hook
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson, C.
Johnson, D..

Johnson, J. McMillan
Johnson, R. Menke
Jopp Miller, D.
Jude Miller, M.
Kahn Moe
Kelly Mueller
Kempe Munger
Klaus Myrah
Knickerbocker Nelson
Knoll Newcome
Kostohryz Niehaus
Kvam Norton
Laidig Ohnstad
Larson Ojala
LaVoy Parish
Lemke Patton
Lindstrom, E. Pavlak, R.
Lindstrom, J. Pavlak, R. L.
Lombardi Pehler
Long Peterson
Mann Pieper
McArthur Pleasant
McCarron Prahl
McCauley Quirin
McEachern Resner
McFarlin Rice

Ryan
St.Onge
Samuelson
Sarna
Savelkoul
Schreiber'
Schulz
Searle
Sherwood
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Skaar
Smith
Spanish
Stangeland
Stanton
Swanson
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vanasek
Vento
Wenzel
Wigley
Wohlwend
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.



6780 JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE [1l2th Day

M,r, Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:

H. F. No. 3164, A bill for an act relating to public transit; pro­
viding for public transportation improvements throughout the
state and public transit demonstration projects; appropriating
money therefor.

PATRICK E. FLAHAYEN, Secretary of the Senate

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

Cummiskey moved that the House concur in the Senate amend­
ments to H. F. No. 3164 and that the bill be repassed as amended
by the Senate. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 3164, A bill for an act relating to public transit; pro­
viding for public transportation improvements throughout the
state and public transit demonstration proj ects; appropriating
money therefor.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage.

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 91, and nays 35, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Kempe Myrah
Knickerbocker Nelson

Adams,J.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, I.
Belisle
Bell
Bennett
Berg
Berg'lin
Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Cleary
Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl
Dieterich

Enebo
Faricy
Ferderer
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hanson
Haugerud
Heinitz
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson, C.
Johnson, D.
Johnson, J.
Jude
Kahn
Kelly

Knoll
Kostohryz
Laidig
LaVoy
Lombardi
McArthur
McCarron
McCauley
McEachern
McFarlin
McMillan
Menke
Miller, D.
Miller, M.
Moe
Mueller
Munger

Newcome
Norton
Ojala
Parish
Patton
Pavlak, R.
Pavlak, R. L.
Pehler
Pieper
Pleasant
Prahl
Quirin
Resner
Rice
Ryan
St.Onge
Sarna

Schreiber
Sherwood
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Spanish
Swanson
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vanasek
Vento
Voss
Wenzel
Wohlwend
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker



112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH 25, 1974 6781

Those who voted in the negative were:

Anderson, D.
Anderson, G.
Becklin
Biersdorf
Braun
Carlson,D.
DeGroat

Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Erdahl
Erickson
Esau
Fjcalten

Hagedorn
Hook
Jopp
Klaus
Kvam
Larson
Lindstrom, E.

Lindstrom, J.
Long
Mann
Niehaus
Ohnstad
Peterson
Samuelson

Savelkoul
Searle
Skaar
Smith
Stangeland
Stanton
Wigley

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.

ANNOUNCEMENTS BY THE SPEAKER

The Speaker announced the appointment of the following
members of the House to the Conference Committee on H. F. No.
2236:

Pavlak, R.; Culhane; Biersdorf; Braun; and Searle.

The Speaker announced the appointment of the following'
members of the House to. the Conference Committee on H. F. No.
2928:

Smith, Searle and Farley.

MESSAGES FROM THE SENATE, Continued

The following messages were received from the Senate:

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:

H. F. No. 2745, A bill for an act relating to municipalities; al­
lowing municipalities to set minimum labor standards in award­
ing contracts; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section
471.345, by adding a subdivision.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

Enebo moved that the House concur in the Senate amendments
to H. F. No. 2745 and that the bill be repassed as amended by the
Senate. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 2745, A bill for an act relating to municipalities;
allowing municipalities to set minimum labor standards in



6782 JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE [1l2th Day

awarding contracts; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section
471.345, by adding a subdivision.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage,

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 82, and nays 46, as follows:

, Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams, J.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, G.
Anderson, I.
Bell
Bennett
Berg
Berglin
Biersdorf
Braun
Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Carlson, R­
Carlson, D.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Connors

Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl
Dieterich
Eneha

. Faricy
Ferderer
Fudro
Fugina
Growe
Hanson
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson, D.
Jude
Kahn
Kelly

Kempe Nelson
Knickerbocker Norton
Knoll Ojala
Kostohryz Parish
LaVoy Patton
Lombardi Pavlak, R.
McArthur Pavlak, R. L.
McCarron Pehler
McCauley Peterson
McEachern Prahl
McFarlin Quirin
McMillan Resner
Menke Rice
Miller, D. Ryan
Miller, M. St.Onge
Moe Samuelson
Munger Sarna

Savelkoul
Schulz
Sherwood
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Spanish
Stanton
Swanson
Tomlinson
Vanasek
Vento
Wenzel
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker

Those who voted in the negative were:

Adams, S.
Anderson, D.
Becklin
Belisle
Cleary
Clifford
DeGroat
Dirlam
Eckstein
Erdahl

Erickson
Esau
Fjoslien
Forsythe
Graw
Hagedorn
Haugerud
Heinitz .
Hook
Johnson, C.

Johnson, J.
Johnson, R.
Jopp
Klaus
Kvam
Laidig
Larson
Lindstrom, E.
Lindstrom, J.
Long

Mann
Mueller
Myrah
Newcome
Niehaus
Ohnstad
Pieper
Pleasant
Schreiber
Searle

Skaar
Smith
Stangeland
Ulland
Wigley
Wohlwend

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:

H. F. No. 2764, A bill for an act relating to private pensions;
imposing an obligation upon certain employers who terminate
pension plans; providing for the enforcement and method pay­
ment of such obligations.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate



112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH '25, 1974

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

6783

Enebo moved that the House concur in the Senate amendments
to H. F. No. 2764 and that the bill be repassed as amended by the
Senate. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 2764, A bill for an act relating to private pensions;
imposing an obligation upon certain employers who terminate
pension plans; providing for the enforcement and method pay­
ment of such obligations.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage.

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill, and the
roll being called, there were yeas 127, and nays 3, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J.
Adams,S.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, D.
Anderson, G.
Anderson, I.
Becklin
Belisle
Bell
Bennett
Berg
Berglin
Biersdorf
Braun
Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Carlson, B.
Carlson. D.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Cleary
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl
DeGroat

Dieterich
Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Enebo
Erdahl
Erickson
Eeau
Faricy
Ferderer
Fjoslien
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn
Hanson
Haugerud
Heinitz
Hook
Jacobs
Jaros
Jobnson, C.
Johnson,D.
Johnson,J.

Johnson, R. Miller, D.
Jopp Miller, M.
Jude Moe
Kahn Mueller
Kelly Munger
Kempe Myrah
Klaus Nelson
Knickerbocker Newcome
Knoll Niehaus
Kostohryz Ohnstad
Kvam Ojala
Laidig Parish
LaVoy Patton
Lemke Pavlak, R.
Lindstrom, E. Pavlak, R. L.
Lindstrom, J. Pehler
Lombardi Peterson
Long Pieper
Mann Prahl
McArthur Quirin
McCarron Resner
McCauley Rice
McEachern Ryan
McFarlin St. Onge
McMillan Samuelson
Menke Sarna

Savelkoul
Schreiber
Schulz
Searle
Sherwood
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Skaar
Smith
Spanish
Stangeland
Stanton
Swanson
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vanasek
Vento
Voss
Wenzel
Wigley
Wohlwend
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker

Those who voted in the negative were:

Clifford Larson Pleasant

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:



6784 JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE [112th Day

H. F. No. 3267, A bill for an act relating to aeronautics; reim­
bursement of municipalities for operational and maintenance
costs of airports; amending Minnesota Statutes, 1973 Supple­
ment, Section 360.305, Subdivision 4.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

Haugerud moved that the House concur in the Senate amend­
ments to H. F. No. 3267 and that the bill be repassed as amended
by the Senate. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 3267, A bill for an act relating to aeronautics; reim­
bursement. of municipalities for operational and maintenance
costs of airports; amending Minnesota Statutes, 1973 Supple­
ment, Section 360.305, Subdivision 4.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage.

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 127, and nays 3, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J.
Adams, S.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, D.
Anderson, G.
Anderson, 1.
Becklin
Belisle
Bell
Bennett
Berg
Berglin
Biersdorf
Braun ­
Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Carlson, B.
Carlson, D.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Cleary
Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl

DeGroat
Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Enebo
Erdahl
Erickson
Esau
Ferderer
Fjoslien
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn
Haugerud
Reinitz
Hook
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson, C:
Johnson, D.
Johnson, J.
.Johnson, R.
Jopp

Jude Miller, M.
Kahn Moe
Kelly Mueller
Kempe Munger
Klaus Myrah
Knickerbocker N elson
Knoll Newcome
Kostohryz Niehaus
Kvam Ohnstad
Laidig Ojala
Larson Parish .
LaVoy Patton
Lemke Pavlak, R.
Lindstrom, E. Pavlak, R. L.
Lindstrom, J. Pehler .
Lombardi Peterson
Long Pieper
Mann Pleasant
McArthur Prahl
McCarron Quirin
McCauley Resner
McEachern Rice
McFarlin Ryan
McMillan St .. Onge
Menke Samuelson
Miller, D. Sarna

Savelkoul­
Schreiber
Schulz
Searle
Sherwood
Sieben; H.
Sieben, M.
Skaar
Smith
Spanish
Stangeland
Stanton
Swanson
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vanasek
Vento
Voss
Wenzel
Wigley
Wohlwend
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker

Those who voted in the negative were:

Dieterich Faricy Hanson

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.



112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH 25, 1974 6785

Anderson, 1., moved that the House recess subject to the call
of the Chair. The motion prevailed.

RECESS

RECONVENED

The House reconvened and was called to order by the Speaker,

MESSAGES FROM THE SENATE, Continued

The following messages were received from the Senate:

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned:

H. F. No. 3140, A bill for an act relating to education; autho­
rizing transfer of funds between Minnesota and Wisconsin for
higher education reciprocity; appropriating money; amending
Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section 136A.08.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce that the Senate has concurred in and adopt­
ed the report of the Conference Committee on:

H. F. No. 636, A bill for an act relating to establishing a metro­
politan transportation commission; assumption by commission
of Twin City area metropolitan transit commission powers;
granting authority to commission to approve highway designs
and locations; establishing budget procedure; amending Minne­
sota Statutes 1971, Chapter 473A, by adding sections; and Sec­
tions 473A.01, Subdivisions 2 and 3, and by adding a subdivision;
473A.02; 473A.03; 473A.04, by adding subdivisions; 473A.05,
Subdivision 10, and by adding a subdivision; 473A.16; 473A.18;
repealing Minnesota Statutes 1971, Sections 473A.04, Subdivi­
sions 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12 and 14; 473A.06, Subdivision
1; and 473A.065.

The Senate has repassed said bill, in accordance with the rec­
ommendation and report of the Conference Committee. Said
House File is herewith returned to the House.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate



6786 .

Mr. Speaker:

JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE [112th Day

I hereby announce that the Senate has concurred in and
adopted the report of the Conference Committee on :

H. F. No. 1835, A bill for .an act regulating public utilities
furnishing at retail natural, manufactured or mixed gas, or
electric service; prescribing the duties of the public service com­
mission in relation thereto; prescribing penalties; increasing the
membership of the public service commission; appropriating
money; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section 216A.03,
Subdivision 1.

The Senate has repassed said bill, in accordance with the rec­
ommendation and report of the Conference Committee. Said
House File is herewith returned to the House.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce that the Senate has concurred in and
adopted the report of the Conference Committee on:

H. F. No. 978, A bill for an act relating to tort liability of poli­
tical subdivisions; extending governmental immunity from tort
liability for certain towns; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971,
Section 466.12, Subdivision 4.

. The Senate has repassed said bill, in accordance with the rec­
ommendation and report of the Conference Committee. Said
House File is herewith returned to the House.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:

H. F. No. 2937, A bill for an act relating to subdivided lands;
application for registration; annual reports; amending Minne­
sota Statutes, 1973 Supplement, Sections 83.20, Subdivision 5;
83.23, Subdivisions 2, 3 and 4; 83.30, Subdivision 1; and 83.38,
by adding a subdivision.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate



112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH 25, 1974

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

6787

Vento moved that the House concur in the Senate amendments
to H. F. No. 2937 and that the bill be repassed as amended by
the Senate. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 2937, A bill for an act relating to subdivided lands;
application for registration; annual reports; amending Minne­
sota Statutes, 1973 Supplement, Sections 83.20, Subdivision 5;
83.23, Subdivisions 2, 3 and 4; 83.30, Subdivision 1; and 83.38,
by adding a subdivision.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage,

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 128, and nays 0, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J.
Adams, S.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, -D.
Anderson, G.
Anderson, 1.
Becklin
Belisle
Ben
Bennett
Berg
Berg'Iin
Biersdorf
Braun
Brinkman
Carlson,.A.
Carlson, B.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Cleary
Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl .
Dieterich

Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Enebc
Erdahl
Erickson
Esau
Faricy
Ferderer
Fjoslien
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn
Hanson
Haugerud
Reinitz
Hook
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson, C.
Johnson, D.
Johnson,J.
Johnson, R.

J opp Miller, D.
Jude Miller, M.
Kahn Moe
Kelly Mueller
Kempe Munger
Klaus Myrah
Knickerbocker Nelson
Knoll Newcome
Kostohryz Niehaus
Kvam Norton
Laidig Ohnstad
Larson Ojala
LaVay Parish
Lemke Patton
Lindstrom. E. Pavlak, R.
Lindstrom, J. Pavlak, R. L.
Lombardi Pehler
Long Peterson
Mann Pieper
McArthur Pleasant
McCarron Prahl
McCauley Quirin
McEachern Rice
McFarlin Ryan
McMillan St. Onge
Menke Salchert

Sarna
Savelkoul
Schreiber
Schulz
Searle
Sherwood
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M;
Skaar
Smith
Spanish
Stangeland.
Sta~tori. ..
Swanson
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vento
Voss
Weaver
Wenzel
Wigley
Wohlwend
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker

,,

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.·

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:



6788 JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE [112th Day

H. F. No. 2715, A bill for an act relating to elections; prohibit.
ing the scheduling of athletic events on a precinct caucus day;
amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Chapter 202, by adding a
section.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

Wenzel moved that the House concur in the Senate amendments
to H. F. No. 2715 and that the bill be repassed as amended by
the Senate. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 2715, A bill for an act relating to elections; pro­
hibiting the scheduling of certain activities on a political party
precinct caucus day; granting employees time off from work dur­
ing precinct caucuses; making public schools available for pre­
cinct caucuses.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage,

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 123, and nays 7, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams.J.
Adams, S.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, G.
Anderson, I.
Bec1din
Belisle
Bennett
Berg
Berglin
Biersdorf
Braun
Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Carlson, B.
Carlson, D.
Carlson,L.
Casserly
Cleary
Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl
Dieterich

Eckstein
Eken
Enebo
Erdahl
Erickson
Esau
Faricy
Ferderer
Fjoslien
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn
Hanson
Haugerud
Heinitz
Hook
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson, C.
Johnson, D.
Johnson, R.
Jopp

Jude Miller, D.
Kahn Miller, M.
Kelly Moe
Kempe Mueller
Klaus Munger
Knickerbocker Myrah
Knoll Nelson
Kostohryz Newcome
Kvam Niehaus
Laidig Norton
Larson Ohnstad
LaVoy Ojala
Lemke Parish
Lindstrom, E. Patton
Lindstrom, J. Pavlak, R.
Lombardi Pavlak, R. L.
Long Pehler
Mann Peterson
McArthur Pieper
McCarron Prahl
McCauley Quirin
McEachern Rice
McFarlin Ryan
McMillan St. Onge
Menke Salchert

Samuelson
Sarna
Savelkoul
Schreiber
Schulz
Searle
Sherwood
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Skaar
Smith
Spanish
Stangeland
Stanton
Swanson
Tomlinson
Vento
Voss
Weaver
Wenzel
Wigley
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker

Those who voted in the negative were:

Anderson, D. Dirlam
DeGroat Johnson, J.

Pleasant Ulland Wohlwend



112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH 25, 1974 6789

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.

Johnson, C., was excused for the remainder of today's session.

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:

H. F. No. 1075, A bill for an act creating a housing and rede­
velopment authority in Washington county; applying the pro­
visions of the municipal housing and redevelopment act to Wash.
ington county.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

Sieben, M., moved that the House concur in the Senate amend­
ments to H. F. No. 1075 and that the bill be repassed as amended
by the Senate. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 1075, A bill for an act relating to local government
in Washington county and the town of Forest Lake; creating a
housing and redevelopment authority in Washington county;
applying the provisions of the municipal housing and redevelop­
ment act in Washington county; exempting the town of Forest
Lake from limitation on tax levies for fire protection.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage.

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 124, and nays 5, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams, J,
Adams, S.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, D.
Anderson, G.
Anderson, I.
Becklin
Belisle
Bell
Bennett
Berg
Berglin
Biersdorf
Braun
Brinkman

Carlson, A.
Carlson, B.
Carlson, D.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Cleary
Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl
Dieterich
Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken

Enebo
Erdahl
Erickson
Esau
Faricy
Ferderer
Fjoslien
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina'
Graw
Growe
Hanson
Heinitz
Hook

Jaeobs Laidig
Jeros Larson
Johnson, D. LaVoy
Johnson, J. Lemke
Johnson, R. Lindstrom,E.
Jopp Lindstrom, J.
Jude Lombardi
Kahn Long
Kelly Mann
Kempe McArthur
Klaus McCarron
Knickerbocker McCauley
Knoll McEachern
Kostohryz McFarlin
Kyam McMillan



6790 JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE [112th Day

Menke Ohnstad Prahl Searle Ulland
Miller, D. Ojala Quirin Sherwood Vento
Miller, M. Parish Rice Sieben, H. Voss
Moe Patton Ryan Sieben, M. Weaver
Mueller Pavlak, R.· St.Onge Skaar Wenzel
Munger Pavlak, R. L. Salchert Smith Wigley
Nelson Pehler Samuelson Spanish Wohlwend
Newcome Peterson Sarna Stanton Wolcott
Niehaus Pieper Savelkoul Swanson Mr. Speaker
Norton Pleasant Schulz Tomlinson

Those who voted in the negative were:

DeGroat Hagedorn Myrah Schreiber Stangeland

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.

M1'. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested :

H. F. No. 677, A bill for an act relating to recreational motor
vehicles; providing limitations on the operation of such vehicles
while on property not owned by the operator; providing penal­
ties; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Chapter 84, by adding
a section.

PATRICK E. FLAHAYEN, Secretary of the Senate

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

Nelson moved that the House concur in the Senate amend­
ments to H. F. No. 677 and that the bill be repassed as amended
by the Senate. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 677, A bill for an act relating to recreational motor
vehicles; providing limitations on the operation of such vehicles
while on property not owned by the operator; providing pen­
alties; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Chapter 84, by adding
a section.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage.·

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 129, and nays 0, as follows:



112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH 25, 1974 6791

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams, J.
Adams, S.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, D.
Anderson, G~
Anderson, I.
Becklin
Belisle
Bell
Bennett
Berg
Berglin
Biersdorf
Braun
Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Carlson, B.
Carlson, D.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Cleary
Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl

DeGroat
Dieterich
Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Enebo
Erdahl
Erickson
Esau
Faricy
Ferderer
Fjoslien
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn
Hanson
Reinitz
Hook
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson, D.
Johnson, J.
Johnson, R.

Jopp Miller, D.
Jude Miller, M.
Kahn Moe
Kelly Mueller
Kempe Munger
Klaus Myrah
Knickerbocker Nelson
Knoll Newcome
Kostohryz Niehaus
Kyam . Norton
Laidig Ohnstad
Larson Ojala
LaVay Parish
Lemke Patton
Lindstrom, E. Pavlak, R.
Lindstrom, J. Pavlak, R. L.
Lombardi Pehler
Long Peterson
Mann Pieper
McArthur Pleasant
McCarron Prahl
McCauley Quirin
McEachern Rice
McFarlin Ryan
McMillan St. Onge
Menke Salchert

Samuelson
Sarna
Savelkoul
Schreiber
Schulz
Searle
Sherwood
Sieben, H. .
Sieben, M.
Skaar
Smith
Spanish
Stangeland
Stanton
Swanson
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vento
Voss
Weaver
Wenzel
Wigley
Wohlwend
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:

H. F. No, 3357, A bill for an act relating to the city of Thief
River Falls; authorizing the issuance of on-sale liquor licenses.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

Skaar moved that the House concur in the Senate amendments
to H. F. No. 3357 and that the bill be repassed as amended by the
Senate. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 3357, A bill for an act relating to the city of Thief
River Falls; authorizing the issuance of on-sale liquor licenses.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage.

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 112, and nays 15, as follows:



6792 JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE [1l2th Day

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J.
Adams,S.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, D.
Anderson,' I.
Belisle
Ben
Bennett
Berg
Berglin
Biersdorf
Braun
Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Carlson, B.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Cleary
Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl

DeGroat
Dieterich
Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Enebo
Faricy
Ferderer
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn
Hanson
Heinitz
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson, D.
Johnson, R.
Jopp
Jude
Kahn

Kelly Munger
Kempe Myrah
Knickerbocker Nelson
Knoll Newcorne
Kostohryz Niehaus
Laidig Norton
LaVoy Ojala
Lemke Parish
Lindstrom',E. Patton
Lindstrom, J. Pavlak, R.
Lombardi Pavlak, R. L.
Mann Pehler
McArthur Peterson
McCarron Pieper
McCauley Pleasant
McEachern Prahl
McFarlin Quirin
McMillan Rice
Menke Ryan
Miller, D. St.Onge
Miller, M. Salchert
Moe Samuelson
Mueller Sarna

Savelkoul
Schreiber
Schulz
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Skaar
Smith
Spanish
Stangeland
Swanson
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vento
Voss
Weaver
Wenzel
Wigley
Wohlwend
Wolcott .
Mr. Speaker

Those who voted in the negative were:

Beckltn
Carlson, D.
Erdahl

Erickson
Esau
Fjoslien

Hook
Johnson, J.
Klaus

Kvam
Larson
Long

Ohnstad
Sherwood
Stanton

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested: .

H. F. No. 3372, A bill for an act relating to Independent School
District No. 141; exempting Independent School District No.
141 from application of certain liquor laws.

PATRICK K FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

Ohnstad moved that the House concur in the Senate amend­
ments to H. F. No. 3372 and that the bill be repassed as amended
by the Senate. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 3372, A bill for an act relating to Independent School
District No. 141; exempting Independent School District No.
141 from application of certain liquor laws.



112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH 25, 1974 6793

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage.

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 107, and nays 19, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J;
Adams, S.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, G.
Anderson, I.
Belisle
Bell
Bennett
Berg
Biersdorf
Braun
Brinkman
Carlson,A.
Carlson,B.
Carlson,L.
Casserly
Cleary
Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl

DeGroat
Dieterich
Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Enebo
Ferderer
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina.
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn
Heinitz
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson,D.
Johnson, J.
Johnson, R.
Jopp
Jude
Kempe

Knickerbocker Munger
Knoll . Myrah
Kostohryz Nelson
Kvam Newcome
Laidig Niehaus
Larson Norton
LaVoy Ohnstad
Lemke Ojala
Lindstrom, E. Parish
Lindstrom, J. Patton
Lombardi Pavlak, R.
McArthur Pavlak, R. L.
McCarron Pehler
McCauley Peterson
McEachern Pieper
McFarlin Pleasant
McMillan Prahl
Menke Quirin
Miller, D. Rice
Miller, M. Ryan
Moe St.Onge
Mueller Salchert

Sarria
Schreiber
Schulz
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Smith
Spanish
Stangeland
Swanson
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vento
Voss
Weaver
Wenzel
Wigley
Wohlwend
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker

Those who voted in the negative were:

Anderson, D.
Becklin
Berglfn
Carlson, D.

Erdahl
Erickson
Esau
Faricy

Fjoslien
Hanson
Hook
Kahn

Kelly
Klaus
Long
Searle

Sherwood
Skaar
Stanton

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:

H. F. No. 210, A bill for an act relating to education; regu­
lating the tenure of teachers and granting seniority rights;
amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section 125.12, Subdivi­
sion 6.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate



6794 JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE

CONCURRENCE. AND REPASSAGE

[112th Day

St. Onge moved that the House concur in the Senate amend­
ments to H. F. No. 210 and that the bill be repassed as amended
by the Senate. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 210, A bill for an act relating to education; regulat­
ing the tenure of teachers and granting seniority rights; amend­
ing Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section 125.12, Subdivision 6, and
by adding subdivisions; Minnesota Statutes, 1973 Supplement,
Section 125.12, Subdivision 4.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage.

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 96, and nays 32, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J. Cummiskey Kelly Munger Savelkoul
Adams, S. Dahl . Kempe Nelson Schreiber
Andersen, R. Dieterich Knickerbocker Newcome Schulz
Anderson, 1. Eken Knoll Norton Sherwood
Becklin Enebo Kostohryz Ohnstad Sieben, H.
Bell Faricy Kvam Ojala Sieben, M.
Bennett Ferderer Laidig Parish Skaar
Berg Fjoslien LaVoy Patton Spanish
Berglin Fudro Lemke Pavlak, R. Swanson
Biersdorf Fugina Mann Pavlak, R. L. Tomlinson
Braun Graw McArthur Pehler Ulland
Brinkman Growe MeCarron Pieper Vento
Carlson, A. Hanson McCauley Prahl Voss
Carlson, B. Haugerud McEachern Quirin Wenzel
Carlson, D. Jacobs McFarlin Rice Wohlwend
Carlson, L. Jaros McMillan Ryan Wolcott
Casserly Johnson, D. Menke St.Onge
Cleary Johnson, J. Miller, D. Salchert
Connors Jude Miller, M. Samuelson
Culhane Kahn Moe Sarna

Those who voted in the negative were:

Anderson, D. Erdahl Johnson, R. Mueller Stangeland
Anderson, G. Erickson Klaus Myrah Stanton
Belisle Esau Larson Niehaus Weaver
Clifford Forsythe Lindstrom, E. Peterson Wigley
DeGroat Hagedorn Lindstrom, J. Pleasant
Dirlam Heinitz Lombardi Searle
Eckstein Hook Long Smith

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House file, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in



112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH 25, 1974 6795

which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:

H. F. No. 2405, A bill for an act relating to elections; requiring
precinct" boundaries to be filed with the secretary of state;
amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section 203.06, Subdivi­
sion 1.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

Belisle moved that the House concur in the Senate amendments
to H. F. No. 2405 and that the bill be repassed as amended by the
Senate. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 2405, A bill for an act relating to elections; requiring
precinct boundaries to be filed with the secretary of state;
amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section 203.06, Subdivi-
sion 1. .

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage,

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 127, and nays 1, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J.
Adams,S.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, D.
Anderson, G.
Anderson. I.
Becklin
Belisle
Bell
Bennett
Berg
Berglin
Biersdorf
Braun
Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Carlson, B.
Carlson..D.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Cleary
Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl

DeGroat
Dieterich
Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Enebo
Erdahl
Erickson
Eaau
Faricy
Ferderer
Fjoslien
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn
Hanson
Haugerud
Reinitz
Hook
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson, D.
Johnson, J.

Johnson, R. Miller, M.
Jopp Moe
Jude Mueller
Kahn Munger
'Kelly Myrah
Kempe Nelson
Klaus Newcome
Knickerbocker Niehaus
Knoll Norton
Kostohryz Ohnstad
Kvam Ojala
Laidig Parish
Larson Patton
LaVoy Pavlak, R.
Lemke Pavlak, R. L.
Lindstrom, E. Pehler
Lindstrom, J. Peterson
Lombardi Pieper
Long Pleasant
Mann Prahl
McArthur Quirin
McCauley Rice
McEachern Ryan
McFarlin St. Onge
Menke Sal chert
Miller, D. Samuelson

Sarna
Savelkoul
Schreiber
Schulz
Sherwood
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Skaar
Smith
Spanish
Stangeland
Stanton
Swanson
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vento
Voss
Weaver
Wenzel
Wigley
Wohlwend
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker



6796 JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE [112th Day

Those who voted in the negative were :

McCarron

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.

M~. Speaker :

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:

H. F. No. 1415, A bill for an act relating to health; develop­
mentally disabled; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Sections
252.24, Subdivisions 1 and 4; 252.25; 252.26; 252.27; and 252.28.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

Berglin moved that the House concur in the Senate amend­
ments to H. F. No. 1415 and that the bill be repassed as amended
by the Senate. The motion prevailed.

H.F. No. 1415, A bill for an act relating to health; providing
for grants to daytime activity centers for mentally retarded and
cerebral palsied persons; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971,
Sections 252.21; 252.23; 252.24, Subdivision 1; 252.25; 252.26;
and Minnesota Statutes, 1973 Supplement, Sections 252.22 and
252.24, Subdivision 4.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage.

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 126, and nays 0, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J.
Adams, S.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, D.
Anderson, G.
Anderson, I.
Becklin
Belisle
Bell
Bennett
Berg
Berglin
Biersdorf
Braun

Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Carlson, B.
Carlson, D.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Cleary
Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl
DeGroat
Dieterich

Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Erdahl
Erickson
Esau
Faricy
Ferderer
Fjos1ien
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe

Hagedorn
Hanson
Heinitz
Hook
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson, D.
Johnson, J.
Johnson,R.
Jopp
Jude
Kahn
Kelly
Kempe

Klaus
Knickerbocker
Knoll
Kostohryz
Kvam
Laidig
Larson
LaVoy
Lemke
Lindstrom, E.
Lindstrom, J.
Lombardi
Long
Mann



112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH 25, 1974 6797

McArthur Nelson Pieper Searle Vento
McCarron, Newcome Pleasant Sherwood Voss
McCauley Niehaus Prahl Sieben, H. Weaver
McEachern Norton Quirin Sieben, M. Wenzel
McFarlin Ohnstad Rice Skaar Wigley
Menke Ojala Ryan Smith Wohlwend
Miller, D. Parish St. Onge Spanish Wolcott
Miller, M.. Patton Salchert Stangeland 'Mr. Speaker
Moe Pavlak, R. Sarna ' Stanton
Mueller Pavlak, R.L. Savelkoul Swanson
Munger Pehler Schreiber ' Tomlinson
Myrah Peterson Schulz Ulland

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.

McMillan was excused for the remainder of today's session.

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House, File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:

H. F. No. 268, A bill for an act relating to courts; initiation
of paternity proceedings; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971,
Section 257.253.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary-of the Senate

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

Lindstrom, J., moved that the House concur in the Senate
amendments to H. F. No. 268 and that the bill be repassed as
amended by the Senate. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 268, A bill for an act relating to courts; initiation
of paternity proceedings; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971,
Section 257.253.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage.

The question being taken on the repassage of the bi1l and the
1'011 being ca1led, there were yeas 129, and nays 0, as follows;

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J~
Adams, S. .
Andersen, R.
Anderson, D.
Anderson, G.
Anderson, I.
Becklin

Belisle
Bell
Bennett
Berg
Berglin
Biersdorf
Braun

Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Carlson, B.
Carlson,D.
Carlson,L.
Casserly
Cleary

Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl
DeGroat
Dieterich

Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Enebo
Erdahl
Erickson
Eaau



6798 JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE [112th Day

Faricy
Ferderer
Fjoslien
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn
Hanson
Haugerud
Reinitz
Hook
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson, D.
Johnson,J.
Johnson..R.
Jopp

Jude McCarron
Kahn McCauley
Kelly McEachern
Kempe McFarlin
Klaus Menke
Knickerbocker Miller, D.
Knoll Miller, M.
Kostohryz Moe
Kyam MueBer
Laidig Munger
Larson Myrah
LaVoy Nelson
Lemke Newcome
Lindstrom, E. Niehaus
Lindstrom, J. Norton
Lombardi Ohnstad
Long Ojala
Mann Parish
McArthur Patton

Pavlak, R.
Pavlak, R. L.:
Pehler
Peterson

. Pieper
Pleasant
Prahl
Quirin
Rice
Ryan
St.Onge
Salchert
Samuelson
Sarna
Savelkoul
Schreiber
Schulz
Searle
Sherwood

Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Skaar .
Smith
Spanish
Stangeland
Stanton
Swanson
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vento
Voss
Weaver
Wenzel
Wigley ­
Wohlwend
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:

H. F. No. 3151, A bill for an act relating to the state; creating
a designer selection board to select architects and engineers for
state building projects and prescribing its powers and duties.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

Lindstrom, J., moved that the House concur in the Senate
amendments to H. F. No. 3151 and that the bill be repassed as
amended by the Senate. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 3151, A bill for an act relating to the state; creating
a designer selection board to select architects and engineers for
state building projects and prescribing its powers and duties.

The bill-was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage.

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 128, and nays 0, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J.
Adams, S.·

Anderaen.B. Anderson, G. Becklin
Anderson, D. Anderson, I. Belisle

Bell.
Bennett



112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH 25, 1974 6799

Berg
Berglin
Biersdorf
Braun
Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Carlson, B.
Carlson, D.'
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Cleary
Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl
DeGroat
Dieterich
Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Eneba
Erdahl
Erickson

Esau
Faricy
Ferderer

. Fjoslien
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn
Hanson
Haugerud
Heinitz
Hook
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson, D.
Johnson, J.
Johnson, R.
Jopp
Jude
Kahn
Kelly
Kempe

Klaus Munger
Knickerbocker Neleon
Knoll Newcome
Kostohryz Niehaus
Kvam Norton
Laidig Ohnstad
Larson Ojala
LaVay Parish
Lemke Patton
Lindstrom, E. Pavlak, R.
Lindstrom, J. Pavlak, R. L.
Lombardi Pehler
Long Peterson
Mann Pieper
McArthur Pleasant
McCarron Prahl
McCauley Quirin
McEachern Rice
McFarlin Ryan
Menke St. Doge
Miller, D. Salchert
Miller, M. Samuelson
Moe Sarna
Mueller Savelkoul

Schreiber
Schulz
Searle
Sherwood
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Skaar
Smith
Spanish
Stangeland
Stanton
Swanson
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vento
Voss
Weaver
Wenzel
Wigley
Wohlwend
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.

M". Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:

H. F. No. 1047, A bill for an act relating to standards of
weight and measure; providing for the gradual implementation
and instruction concerning the metric system of weights and
measures.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

McCauley moved that the House concur in the Senate amend­
ments to H. F. No. 1047 and that the bill be repassed as amended
by the Senate. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 1047, A bill for an act relating to standards of
weight and measure; providing for the gradual implementation
and instruction concerning the metric system of weights and
measures.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage.

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 123, and nays 4, as follows:



6800 JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE [112th Day

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J.
Adams, S.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, ..G.
Anderson, 1.
Becklin
Belisle
Bell
Bennett
Berg
Bergltn
Biersdorf
Braun
Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Carlson, D.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Cleary
Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl
DeGroat

Dieterich
Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Enebo
Erdahl
Erickson
Esau
Faricy
Ferderer
F'josllen
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn
Hanson
Heinitz
Hook
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson,D.
Johnson, J.
Johnson, R.

Jopp Miller, D.
Jude Miller, M.
Kahn Moe
Kelly Mueller
Kempe Munger
Klaus Myrah
Knickerbocker Nelson
][noll ~ewcome

Kostohryz Niehaus
.Kvam Norton
Laidig Ohnstad
Larson Ojala
LaVay Parish
Lemke Patton
Lindstrom, E. Pavlak, R. L.
Lindstrom, J. Pehler
Lombardi Peterson
Long Pieper
Mann Pleasant
McArthur Prahl
McCarron Quirin
McCauley Rice
McEachern Ryan
McFarlin Salchert
Menke Samuelson

Sarna
Savelkoul
Schreiber
Schulz
Searle
Sherwood
Sieben, H.
Sieben,M.
Skaar
Smith
Spanish
Stanton
Swan.son-,
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vento
Voss
Weaver
Wenzel
Wigley
Wohlwend
Wolcott
~r. Speaker

Those who voted in the negative were:

Anderson, D. Carlson, B. Pavlak, R. Stangeland

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:

H. F. No. 3060, A bill for an act relating to retirement; trans­
ferring duties of the state auditor and treasurer in connection
with legislator's, constitutional officer's and judge's retirement
to the executive director of the Minnesota state retirement sys­
tem; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Sections 3A.01, by add­
ing a subdivision; 3A.02, Subdivision 3; 3A.03, Subdivision 2;
3A.04, Subdivisions 3 and 4; 3A.05; 352C.03, Subdivision 2;
352C.04, Subdivision 3; 352C.05; 352C.09; 490.025, Subdivision
8; 490.102, Subdivisions 4 and 8; and 490.12, Subdivisions 2 and
8; and Minnesota Statutes, 1973 Supplement, Sections 3A.02,
Subdivisions 1 and 2; 3A.03, Subdivision 1; 3A.H, Subdivisions
1 and 4; and 490.025, Subdivision 2.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate



112th Day] MONDAY,. MARCH 25, 1974

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

6801

Patton moved that the House concur in the Senate amendments
to H. F. No. 3060 and that the bill be repassed as amended by the
Senate. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 3060, A bill for an act relating to retirement; trans­
ferring duties of the state auditor and treasurer in connection
with legislator's, constitutional officer's and judge's retirement
to the executive director of the Minnesota state retirement sys­
tem; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Sections 3A.Ol, by
adding a subdivision; 3A.02, Subdivision 3; 3A.03, Subdivision
2; 3A.04, Subdivisions 3 and 4; 3A.05; 352C.03, Subdivision 2;
352C.04, Subdivision 3; 352C.05; 352C.09; 490.025, Subdivision
8; 490.102, Subdivisions 4 and 8; and 490.12, Subdivision 8; and
Minnesota Statutes, 1973 Supplement, Sections 3A.02, Subdivi­
sions 1 and 2; 3A.03, Subdivision 1; 3A.ll, Subdivisions 1 and
4; and 490.025, Subdivision 2.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage.

The question being taken on the repassage of the hill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 128, and nays 0, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J.
Adams. S.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, D.
Anderson, G.
Anderson,L
Becklin
Belisle
Bell
Bennett
Berg
Berglin
Biersdorf
Braun
Brinkman
Carlson, A..
Carlson, B.
Carlson, D.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Cleary
Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey'
Dahl

DeGroat
Dieterich
Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Eneha
Erdahl
Erickson
Esau
Faricy
Ferderer
Fjoslien
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn
Hanson
Heinitz
Hook
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson, D.
Johnson, J.
Johnson, R.

Jopp Miller, M.
Jude Moe
Kahn Mueller
Kelly Munger
Kempe Myrah
Klaus Nelson
Knickerbocker Newcome
Knoll Niehaus
Kostohryz Norton
Kvam Ohnstad
Laidig Ojala
Larson . Parish
LaVoy Patton
Lemke Pavlak, R.
Lindstrom, E. Pavlak, R. L.
Lindstrom, J. Pehler
Lombardi Peterson
Long Pieper
Mann Pleasant
McArthur Prahl
McCarron Quirin
McCauley. Rice
McEachern Ryan
McFarlin St. Onge
Menke Sal chert
Miller, D. Samuelson

Sarna
Savelkoul
Schreiber
Schulz
Searle
Sherwood
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Skaar
Smith
Spanish
Stangeland
Stanton
Swanson
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vento
Voss
Weaver
Wenzel
Wigley
Wohlwend
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.



6802

Mr. Speaker:

JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE [1l2th Day

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:

H. F. No. 1386, A bill for an act relating to insurance; requir­
ing insurance agents to issue written memoranda with respect to
new or altered insurance coverage; providing a penalty; amend­
ing Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section 60A.17, by adding subdivi­
sions.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

Cummiskey moved that the House concur in the Senate amend­
ments to H. F. No. 1386 and that the bill be repassed as amended
by the Senate. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 1386, A bill for an act relating to insurance; requir­
ing insurance agents to issue written memoranda with respect
to new or altered insurance coverage; providing a penalty;
amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section 60A.17, by 'adding a
subdivision.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage,

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 125, and nays 0, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J.
Adams, S.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, D.
Anderson, G.
Anderson, I.
Becklin
Belisle
Bennett
Berg
Bergl'in
Braun
Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Carlson, B.
Carlson, D.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Cleary
Clifford
Connors

Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl
DeGroat
Dieterich
Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Enebo
Erdahl
Erickson
Esau
Farlcy
Ferderer

. Fjoslien
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn

Hanson Lemke
Reinitz Lindstrom, E.
Hook Lindstrom, J.
Jacobe Lombardi
Jaros Long
Johnson, D. Mann
J ohnson, J. McArthur
Johnson, R. McCarron
Jopp McCauley
Jude McEachern
Kahn McFarlin
Kelly Menke
Kempe Miller, D.
Klaus Miller, M.
Knickerbocker Moe
Knoll Mueller
Kostohryz Munger
Kvam Myrah
Laidig Nelson
Larson Newcome
LaVoy Niehaus

Norton
Ohnstad
Ojala
Parish
Patton
Pavlak, R.
Pavlak, R. L.
Pehler
Peterson
Pieper
Prahl
Quirin
Rice
Ryan
St.Onge
Salchert
Samuelson
Sarna
Savelkoul
Schreiber
Schulz



112th Day] MONDAY,.MARCH 25, 1974 6803

Searle Skaar Stanton Vento Wigley
Sherwood Smith Swanson Voss Wohlwend
Sieben, H~ Spanish Tomlinson Weaver Wolcott
Sieben, M. Stangeland ' Ulland Wenzel Mr. Speaker

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:

H. F. No. 2844, A bill for an act relating to the Minnehaha
creek watershed district; providing for taxes.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

Knickerbocker moved that the House concur in the Senate
amendments to H. F. No. 2844 and that the bill be repassed as
amended by the Senate. The motion prevailed.

II. F. No. 2844, A bill for an act relating to the Minnehaha
creek watershed district; providing for taxes.

The billwas read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage,

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 128,and nays 1, as' follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, D.
Anderson, G.
Anderson, I.
Becklin
Belisle
Bell
Bennett
Berg
Berglin
Biersdorf
Braun
Carlson, A.
Carlson, B.
Carlson, D.
Carlson, L.
Casserly

Cleary
Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl
DeGroat
Dieterich
Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Enebo
Erdahl
Erickson
Esan
Faricy
Ferderer
Fjoslien

Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn
Hanson
Haugerud
Reinitz
Hook
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson, D.
Johnson, R.
Jopp
Jude
Kahn
Kelly

Kempe McEachern
Klaus McFarlin
Knickerbocker Menke
Knoll Miller, D.
Kostohryz Miller, M.
Kvam Moe
Laidig Mueller
Larson Munger
LaVoy Myrah
Lemke Nelson
Lindstrom, E. Newcome
Lindstrom, J. Niehaus
Lombardi Norton
Long Ohnstad
Mann Ojala
McArthur Parish
McCarron Patton
McCauley Pavlak, R.



6804 JOURNAL OF THE ,HOUSE [112th Day

Pavlak, R. L. -Rice
Pehler Ryan
Peterson St, Onge
Pieper Sal chert
Pleasant Samuelson
Prahl Sarna
Quirin Savelkoul
Resner Schreiber

Schulz
Searle
Sherwood
Sieben, H-.
Sieben. M.
Skaar
Smith
Spanish

Stangeland
Stanton
Swanson
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vanasek
Vento
Voss

Weaver
Wenzel
Wigley
Wohlwend
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker

Those who voted in the negative were:

Johnsoa.T.

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:

H. F. No. 3436, A bill for an act relating to the state building
code; adopting the uniform fire code.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

Cummiskey moved that the House concur in the Senate amend­
ments to H. F. No. 3436 and that the bill be repassed as amended
by the Senate. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 3436, A bill for an act relating to public safety; au­
thorizing the commissioner of public safety to promulgate a
uniform fire code; adopting the uniform fire code, 1973 edition,
promulgated by the international conference of building officials
and the western fire chiefs association, until the commissioner
promulgates a code.

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage.

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 128, and nays 1, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J. Becklin Bergltn Carlson, B. Clifford
Adams, S. Belisle Biersdorf Carlson, D. Connors
Andersen, R. Bell Braun Carlson, L. Culhane
Anderson, G. Bennett Brinkman Casserly Cummiskey
Anderson, I. Berg Carlson, A. Cleary Dahl



112th Day]

•
MONDAY, MARCH 25, 1974 6805

DeGroat
Dieterich
Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Enebo
Erdahl
Erickson
Esau
Faricy
Ferderer
Fjoslien
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn
Hanson
Haugerud
Reinitz

Hook Lombardi
Jacobs Long
Jaros Mann
Johnson, D. McArthur
Johnson, J. McCarron
Johnson, R. McCauley
Jopp McEachern
Jude McFarlin
Kahn Menke
Kelly Miller, D.
Kempe Miller, M.
Klaus Moe
Knickerbocker Mueller
Knoll Munger
Kostohryz Myrah
Laidig Nelson
Larson Newcome
LaVay Niehaus
Lemke Norton
Lindstrom, E. Ohnstad
Lindstrom, J. Ojala

Parish
Patton
Pavlak, R.
Pavlak, R. L.
Pehler
Peterson
Pieper
Pleasant
Prahl
Quirin
Resner
Rice
Ryan
St.Ooge
Salchert
Samuelson
Sarna
SaveIkouI
Schreiber
Schulz
Searle

Sherwood
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Skaar
Smith
Spanish
Stangeland
Stanton
Swanson
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vento
Voss
Weaver
Wenzel
Wigley
Wohlwend
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker

Those who voted in the negative were:

Anderson, D.

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to..

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House, is respectfully
requested:

H. F. No. 2458, A bill for an act relating to political subdivi­
sions; conditioning authorization for expenditures in connection
with membership in certain associations on the filing of financial
statements; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section 471.96,
Subdivision 1; repealing Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section
471.96, Subdivision 2.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

CONCURRENCE AND REPASSAGE

Cummiskey moved that the House concur in the Senate amend­
ments to H. F. No. 2458 and that the bill be repassed as amended
by the Senate. The motion prevailed.

H. F. No. 2458, A bill for an act relating to soil and water
conservation districts; authorizing membership in state. and na­
tional associations; amending Minnesota Statutes 1971, Section
40.07, by adding a subdivision.



6806 JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE· [112th Day

The bill was read for the third time, as amended by the Senate,
and placed upon its repassage,

The question being taken on the repassage of the bill and the
roll being called, there were yeas 131, and nays 0, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J.
Adams, S.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, D.
Anderson, G.
Anderson, I.
Becklin
Belisle
Bell
Bennett
Berg
Berglin
Bieradcrf
Braun
Brinkman
Carlson, A.
Carlson. B.
Carlson; D.
Carlson, L.
Casserly
Cleary
Clifford
Connors
Culhane
Cummiskey
Dahl
DeGroat

Dieterich
Dirlam
Eckstein
Eken
Enebo
Erdahl
Erickson
Esau
Faricy
Ferderer
Fjoslien
Forsythe
Fudro
Fugina
Graw
Growe
Hagedorn
Hanson·
Haugerud
Heinitz
Hook
Jacobs
Jaros
Johnson, D.
Johnson,J.
Johnson, R,
Jopp

Jude Mueller
Kahn Munger
Kelly Myrah
Kempe Nelson
Klaus Newcome
Knickerbocker Niehaus
Knoll Norton
Kostohryz Ohnstad
Kvam Ojala
Laidig Parish
Larson Patton
LaVoy Pavlak, R.
Lemke Pavlak, R. L.
Lindstrom, E. Pehler
Lindstrom, J. Peterson
Lombardi Pieper
Long Pleasant
Mann Prahl
M:cAr'thur Quirin
McCarron Resner
McCauley Rice
McEachern Ryan
McFarlin St. Onge
Menke Salchert
Miller, D. Samuelson
Miller, M. Sarna
Moe Savelkoul

Schreiber
Schulz
Searle
Sherwood
Sieben, H.
Sieben, M.
Skaar
Smith
Spanish
Stangeland
Stanton
Swanson
Tomlinson
Ulland
Vanasek
Vento
Voss
Weaver
Wenzel
Wigley
Wohlwend
Wolcott
Mr. Speaker

The bill was repassed, as amended by the Senate, and its title
agreed to.

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
House File, herewith returned, as amended by the Senate, in
which amendment the concurrence of the House is respectfully
requested:

H. F. No. 3707, A bill for an act relating to taxation; providing
for the taxation of oleomargarine and liquor; amending Minne­
sota Statutes 1971, Section 33.10, Subdivision 1 and by adding
a subdivision; and Minnesota Statutes, 1973 Supplement, Section
340.47, Subdivision 1.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate

Johnson, D., moved that the House refuse to concur in the Sen­
ate amendments to H. F. No. 3707, that the Speaker appoint a
Conference Committee of 5 members of the House, and that the



112th Day] MONDAY, MARCH 25, 1974 6807

House requests that a like committee be appointed by the Senate
to confer on the disagreeing votes of the two Houses.

A roll call was requested and properly seconded.

The question was taken on the motion and the roll being called,
there were yeas 69, and nays 59, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:

Adams,J. Enebo Knoll Ojala Sarna
Anderson, 1. Faricy Kostohryz Parish Sherwood
Berg Fudro LaVoy Patton Sieben, H.
Berglin Fugina 'Lindstrom, J. Pavlak, R. Sieben, M.
Braun Graba Mann Pehler Smith
Brinkman Growe McCarron Peterson Spanish
Carlson, B. Hanson McEachern Prahl Swanson
Carlson.L. Haugerud Menke Qui~in Tomlinson
Casserly Jacobs Miller, D. Resner Vanasek
Connors Jaros Miller, M. Rice Vento
Cummiskey Johnson, D. Moe Ryan Voss
Dahl Jude Munger. St.Onge Wenzel
Dieterich Kahn Nelson Salchert Mr. Speaker
Eken Kelly Norton Samuelson

Those who voted in the negative were:

Adams, S.
Andersen, R.
Anderson, D.
Becklin
Belisle
Bell
Bennett
Biersdorf
Carlson, A.
Carlson, D.
Cleary
Clifford

Culhane
DeGroat
Dirlam
Eckstein
Erdahl
Erickson
Esau
Ferderer
Fjoslien
Forsythe
Graw
Hagedorn

Heinitz Long
Hook McArthur
Johnson, J. McCauley
Johnson, R. McFarlin
Jopp Mueller
Kempe Myrah
Klaus Newcome
Knickerbocker Niehaus
Kvam Ohnstad
Laidig Pavlak, R. L.
Lindstrom, E. Pieper
Lombardi Pleasant

Savelkoul
Schreiber
Schulz
Searle
Skaar
Stangeland
Stanton
Ulland
Weaver
Wigley
Wolcott

The motion prevailed.

Mr. Speaker:

I hereby announce the passage by the Senate of the following
Senate File, herewith transmitted:

S. F. No. 3308.

PATRICK E. FLAHAVEN, Secretary of the Senate



6808 JOURNAL OF THE HOUSE [112th Day

FIRST READING OF SENATE BILLS

S. F. No. 3308, A bill for an act creating a legislative commis­
sion to study and propose legislation relating to the problem of
organized crime; appropriating money therefor.

The bill was read for the first time and referred to the Com.
mittee on Rules and Legislative Administration.

ADJOURNMENT

Mr. Anderson, I., moved that when the House adjourns today
it adjourn until 12 :00 noon, Tuesday, March 26, 1974. The mo­
tion prevailed.

Mr. Anderson, I., moved that the House adjourn. The motion
prevailed, and the Speaker declaredthe House .stands adjourned
until 12 :00 noon, Tuesday, March 26, 1974.

EDWARD A. BURDICK, Chief Clerk, House of Representatives




