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nesota hereby declares its sense of loss because of his death, and we
extend our deepest sympathy to his bereaved family, and that a copy
of this Resolution, as engrossed by the Chief Clerk, be sent to his
family as a means of our esteem and as a token of our affection for
our departed. comrade and friend.

:M:r. Lundeen moved that the foregoing Resolution be adupted.
vVhich motion prevailed and the Resolution vvas unanin~ously

adopted.

:lVIessrs. Johnson, J. A., and Burnap offered the following Resolu­
tion:

lVhel'eas, Honorable :Martin "V. Williams, a member of the HOllJ.'Se
during the sessions of 1913 and 1931, was called by .Almighty God
to his eternal re,vard on April 7, 1943,. and

1tVhe1'eas, His life was an example and inspiration for the present
and succeeding generations of citizens of thilS state; a:q.d

TVhe1'eas, In his contacts with .his fellowmen he was earnest, sin­
cere, congenial and kindly, and in his public life wholeheartedly
devoted to the service of the best interests of the State; and

vVhe1'eas, During his long and distinguished public service he also
occupied the position of president of the State school board associa­
tion, mayor of Lanesboro, assessor, president of the board of educa­
tion, justice of the peace, member of the park board, and other im­
portant public offices; now therefore be it

Resolv'ed, That the House of Repre,'Sentatives of the State of JYIin­
nesota, hereby declare our sense of loss because of his death, and
extend our deepest sympathy to his bereaved family, and that a copy
6f this Resolution be sent to his family ai'S a mark of our esteem, and
as a token of our affection for our departed comrade and friend.

:1\11' . Burnap moved that the foregoing Resolution be adopted.
Which motion prevailed and .the Resolution was unanimously

adopted.

JY~essrs. Dunn and :Memmer offered the following Resolution:
llfThereas, By report of the Committee on Rules, adopted January

27, 1943, the offer of certain students of the Law School of the Uni­
versity .of Minnesota to assist without payment therefor with the
work or the Legal Bureau of the House of Representatives was ac­
cepted and, pursuant thereto, Sidney Lorberbaum, Hamilton Luther,
Stuart Rider, Irvin Sc'hermer, and Frederick Thorson of Minneapo­
lis, Robert Carlson of Granite Falls, and Jacob Schway of St. Paul,
all of whom are students tinder Professor Horace E. Reed of the Uni­
versity of JYIinnesota, rendered services in association with the Legal
Bureau of the 53rd Session of the Legislature of the State of Minne­
sota; and

11The1'eas, The voluntary services of these young men, under the
helpful supervision and counsel of their instructor, often involved
considerable research, study and helpful cOllsultation with 11lany of
the members of the Honse of Representatives, and the lawyers em­
ployed by it, resulting in the orderly and practical preparation of
proposed legislation throughout this Session;

Now, The1'e!O'l'e, Be It Resolved, That the members of the House of
Representatives do hereby officially express to Professor Horace E.
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